
1

FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

20 JANUARY 1982Vol XCI No. 1

Transfers
Miss Pauline Sackett, Clerk, Public Service to 

Woman Police Constable/Clerk, Police & Prisons 
Department 1.1.82. (On probation).

Andrew Samuel Brownlee, Constable, Police & 
Prisons Department to Assistant Income Tax Officer 
1.1.82. (On probation).

NOTICES
Plant and Transport Authority Ordinance 1978

( Section 9(d))
His Excellency the Governor has been pleased 

to appoint the Honourable T. J. Peck, c.p.m., to be 
a member of the Plant and Transport Authority.

6th January 1982.

No. 1. 8th January 1982.

The following revised list of Magistrates, Justices of the Peace, and Commissioners for Oaths at 
present resident in the Colony and Dependencies is published for general information.

MAGISTRATES AND JUSTICES OF THE PEACE
22.7.46 

3.6.55 
17.9.57
2.5.60
4.5.61 

11.7.63
5.8.67 

12.7.69 
12.7.69 
12.7.69 

27.10.80 
30.10.74 

8.11.78 
9.2.81

H. Bennett, o.b.e., j.p., Senior Magistrate 
S. Miller, c.b.e., j.p.
Mrs. C. Luxton, j.p.
A. B. Monk, o.b.e., j.p.
J. T. Clement, j.p.
H. L. Bound, m.b.e., j.p. ...
Mrs. J. Booth, j.p.
Hon. W. H. Goss, m.b.e., j.p.
Hon. L. G. Blake, o.b.e., j.p. 
f. D. Barton, j.p. ...
P. R. Witty, Magistrate
B. Hardcastle, j.p.
R. H. Checkley, j.p.
J. R. Cockwell, j.p.

Stanley 
Stanley 
Stanley 
Stanley 
Stanley 
Stanley 
Stanley 
Stanley 

Hill Cove 
Teal Inlet 

South Georgia 
Darwin 
Stanley 

Fox Bay East

COMMISSIONERS FOR OATHS
8.2.71
8.2.71
8.2.71
8.2.71
8.2.71
8.2.71
8.2.71
8.2.71
8.2.71

23.3.71
23.3.71

5.7.73
23.11.73

26.2.81
31.3.81

G. O. Evans
R. J. Ferguson ... 
Hon. W. R. Luxton 
A. C. Miller
S. R. Miller
K. J. McPhee ...
R. B. Napier
R. M. Pitaluga, o.b.e.
O. R. Smith
L. Grant
A. Pole-Evans ...
A. T. Blake
P. C. Robertson ...
N. A. Knight
R. M. Lee

Pebble Island 
Weddell Island 

Chartres 
... Port San Carlos 

Keppel Island 
Green Patch 

West Point Island 
Salvador 

Johnsons Harbour 
Port Louis 

... Saunders Island 
North Arm 

Port Stephens 
Fox Bay West 
Port Howard

Ref. LEC/19/5C.



2

15th January 1982.No. 2.

The Extradition (Tokyo Convention) (Amendment) and (Amendment No. 2) Orders 1981
(S.I. No s. 213 and 734)

The Extradition (Genocide) (Amendment) Order 1981 
(S.I. No. 209)

The Extradition (Hijacking) (Amendment) and (Amendment No. 2) Orders 1981
(S.I. No’s. 210 and 731)

The Extradition (Protection of Aircraft) (Amendment) and (Amendment No. 2) Orders 1981
(S.I. No’s 212 and 733)

The Extradition (Internationally Protected Persons) (Amendment) and 
(Amendment No. 2) Orders 1981 

(S.I. No’s. 211 and 732)

It is notified for general information that the above named Orders made by Her Majesty the Queen in 
Council amend principal Orders which are applicable to the Colony and Dependencies, and copies may be 
seen at the Chief Secretary’s Office during normal office hours.

Ref. LEG/ 10/22C.

THE COMPANIES ACT, 1948 
Members’ Voluntary Winding up

NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT OF LIQUIDATOR
Pursuant to Section 305

Name of Company— Bertrand and Felton Limited.

Nature of Business — Sheep Farming.

Address of Registered Office— 5 Crozier Place, Stanley.

Liquidator's name and address— Henry Millar Milne,
P. O. Box 163, Ross Road, Stanley, Falkland Islands.

Date of Appointment— 27th December 1981.

By whom Appointed— Shareholders in Extraordinary General Meeting.

Signed Henry M. Milne, 
Liquidator.

Witness to the Signature of

Henry Millar Milne

Name— Harold Bennett,
Address— Stanley, Falkland Islands.

H. Bennett, 
Senior Magistrate.

Advertisement for Creditors

In the Matter of Bertrand & Felton Limited 
and

In the Matter of the Companies Act, 1948.

Notice is hereby given that the creditors of the above-named company, which is being voluntarily wound 
up, are required, on or before the 22nd day of February 1982, being the day for that purpose fixed by the 
undersigned Henry Millar Milne of Stanley, the liquidator of the said company, to send their names and 
addresses, and the particulars of their debts or claims, and the names and addresses of their solicitors, if 
any, to the undersigned, and, if so required by notice in writing from the said liquidator, are by their 
solicitors to come in and prove their said debts or claims at such time and place as shall be specified in 
such notice, or in default thereof they will be excluded from the benefit of any distribution made before 
such debts are proved.

Henry M. Milne, 
Liquidator.8th January 1982.



Registration of United Kingdom Trade Marks Ordinance (Cap. 59)
The following list of Trade Marks Registrations renewed in the Falkland Islands during the period 1st January 1979 to 31st December 1980 

is published for general information. The Trade Marks Register may be inspected at the Office of the Registrar General, Stanley.
R. H. Checkley, 

Registrar General.
Effective
date of 
renewal

Registra
tion No.

Renewal
No. Proprietor Description of Goods

5836 6659 17.12.78
27.4.79 
9.3.79

28.3.79
30.11.78
5.10.78
27.3.79
10.1.79
22.6.79

Bacardi & Company Limited
William Grant & Sons Limited .....................................
Royal Business Machines Inc....................................................
Macdonald Greenlees Limited.............. .........................
John Walker & Sons Limited.................................................
Brown & Williamson Tobacco Corporation (Export) Limited 
Gallaher Limited ...
Mars Limited ........................................................................
E.M.I. Records Limited..............

Wines, spirits (beverages) and liqueurs.
Whisky.
Adding machines incorporating means of typing results.
Whisky.
Whisky.
Tobacco, whether manufactured or unmanufactured.
Tobacco, manufactured or unmanufactured.
Food for animals and for birds.
Apparatus, instruments and devices for the recording, reproducing, transmission or reception 

of sound, included in Class 8.
Boots, shoes and slippers.
Scientific, electrical and electronic apparatus and instruments, scientific utensils for 

chemicals, monitoring instruments and apparatus, punched card operated machines for 
office use, photo copying apparatus, coinfreed or counterfreed apparatus, all included in 
Class 9, etc.

Tobacco whether manufactured or unmanufactured.
Cigarettes for export from the United Kingdom to and sale in countries outside the United 

Kingdom.
Manufactured tobacco.
Tobacco, whether manufactured or unmanufactured, all being goods for export except to 

the Republic of Ireland, the United States of America, Cuba, Puerto Rico and the 
Phillippine Is.

Electronic data processing apparatus and instruments; peripheral apparatus and instruments, 
all for process control in industrial processes; electronic storage and retrieval inform
ation apparatus for use with data processing systems, etc.

Tobacco, whether manufactured or unmanufactured, all being goods for export except to 
the Republic of Ireland.

Perfumes, toilet preparations (not medicated), cosmetic preparations, dentifrices, depilatory 
preparations, toilet articles (not included in other classes) sachets for use in waving the 
hair, toilet soaps and essential oils.

Anti-freezing preparations in fluid form.
Whisky.

3457 6683
5768 6689
5849 6697
1905 6707
5554 6708
5937 6709
6583 6710
2885 6712

6374 Clarks Overseas Shoes Limited ...6713 12.6.79
20.3.795852 Minolta Camera Kabushiki Kaisha (Minolta Camera Company6717

Limited)

British American Tobacco Company Limited 
British American Tobacco Company Limited

3671 6720 24.10.78
9.9.785532

formerly 5513
6723

British American Tobacco Company Limited 
British American Tobacco Company Limited

2329 6724 11.1.79
16.6.795755 6731

6031 BASF Aktiengesellschaft6732 6.10.79

5744 6733 25.4.79 Imasco Limited

5104 6734 28.5.79 Cussons (International) Limited

6474 6746 17.1.79
11.8.79

Castrol Limited ..............
White Horse Distillers Limited5196 6753

u



■U.

Effective 
date of 
renewal

Rcgistra- Renewal 
tion No. Proprietor Description of GoodsNo.

1433 Arthur Guinness Son & Company (Dublin) Limited 
Sterling Products International Incorporated
Amstcl Brouwerij B.V.................. .
Reckitt & Colman (Overseas) Limited..............
Rcckitt & Colman (Overseas) Limited..............
Coates & Co (Plymouth) Limited ..............
Texwood Limited..................................................
Cadbury Limited..........................................................
Mars Limited ...........................................................

6754 24.7.79
13.10.79
25.2.79
15.9.79
12.6.79
4.8.79

20.11.79
5.8.79 
5.9.81

12.3.79

Stout.
A medicated preparation for human use for liver ailments.
Beer, ale and porter.
Mustard, mustard preparations and condiment sauces all being goods included in Class 42. 
Polishing and cleaning preparations included in Class 50.
Gin.
Jeans being articles of clothing, jackets, trousers, shorts, boiler suits and overalls. 
Confectionery, cocoa, chocolate, chocolate biscuits and tea.
Non-medicated sugar confectionery and toffee.

1738 6757
5877 6764
6643 6767
4414 6768
2161 6770
6*159 6772
1737 6783

6590 6784
Schimmclpenninck Sigarenfabrieken v/h Geurts &4659 6785

All goods included in Class 24.
Furniture, mirrors included in Class 20 (Schedule IV), picture frames; and articles included 

in Class 20 (Schedule IV) made of wood, cork, reeds, wicker, celluloid and of imitations 
of all these materials.

Glassware, porcelain and earthenware, small hardware and holloware; and brushes, all in
cluded in Class 21; and non-electric instruments and materials included in Class 21 for 
cleaning purposes.

Liqueurs.
Non-alcoholic beverages and preparations for making such beverages, all included in 

Class 32.
Tobacco, whether manufactured or unmanufactured.
Substances for smoking, all for use as substitutes for tobacco, none being for medical or 

curative purposes; tobacco, whether manufactured or unmanufactured; all being in flake 
form or produced from flake tobacco.

Cigarettes.
Insecticides, fungicides, herbicides and weedkilling preparations.
Cocoa, chocolate, chocolate confectionery, chocolate biscuits, sugar confectionery, bon-bons, 

composed of nuts or fruits, crystallized flowers being boiled sugar goods in Clas 42.
Whisky.
Manufactured tobacco.
Electron discharge tubes for generating and amplifying electro-magnetic waves; electrical 

rectifying and gas discharge tubes; electron image intensifiers; radio communication 
apparatus and instruments: electrical pulse generators and transformers; electrical power 
supply units included in Class 9, etc.

Cigarettes.
Razors, razor blades, razor cases, razor strops, mechanical sharpeners for safety razor blades, 

hand tools, hand instruments included in Class 8, cutlery (other than surgical cutlery) 
forks and spoons.

Printed matter, periodical publications, and books.
Replacement parts included in Class 9 for motor land vehicles.
Replacement parts included in Class 11 for motor land vehicles.

Van Schuppcn BV
N.V. Philips’ Gloeilampenfabrieken3853 6788 10.11.79

N.V. Philips’ Gloeilampenfabrieken3854 6789 10.11.79

The Drambuie Liqueur Company Limited 
The Coca-Cola Company ..........................

5819 6809 15.11.79
26.10.795859 6S15

B.A.T. Cigarettcn-Fabriken G.m.b.H. ... 
British-American Tobaco Company Limited ...

6260 6827 21.8.79
22.8.795785 6828

Moorgate Tobacco Co., Limited 
Imperial Chemical Industries Limited 
Cadbury Limited..........................

3863 6830 9.10.79 
8.9.79

17.7.79
5939 6833
1617 6835
1904 6842 John Walker & Sons Limited ... 

Rothmans of Pall Mall Limited 
Varian Associates Inc....................

24.1.80
18.5.79
28.2.80

4119 6846
6653 6851

5847 6882 Ardath Tobaco Company Limited 
Biro Bic Limited..........................

12.12.79
14.4.806273 6893

3822 6898 N.V. Philips' Gloeilampenfabrieken 
Ford Motor Company 
Ford Motor Company

14.4.80
14.3.80 
14.3.80

6244 6902
6245 6903



Effective 
date of 
renewal

Description of GoodsRegistra- Renewal 
tion No. No.

Proprietor

Replacement parts included in Class 7 for motor land vehicles.
Carpets, mats included in Class 27, rugs (fleor coverings), carpet tiles, matting and floor 

covering materials.
Porcelain figurines (statuettes).

Ford Motor Company ... 
Heuga Export A.G.

14.3.80
27.9.79

69046247
69065824

Jose Lladro Dolz.........................
Philip Morris & Company, Limited
S. Simpson, Limited ..........................
E. Griffiths Hughes, Limited ..............

27.11.79
2.4.80

13.4.80
31.5.80

69085894 Cigarettes.
69093328 Suits, being articles of clothing

Medicated preparations for human use in the treatment of indigestion, acidity, and similar 
digestive ailments.

Replacement parts included in Class 12 for motor land vehicles.
Non-alcoholic beverages included in Class 32.
Mineral and aerated waters, natural and artificial, including ginger beer.

chocolate bon-bons, chocolate biscuits, drinking chocolate, chocolate coafec- 
confectionery (none being medicated); tea, coffee, cocoa, preparations 

and other food preparations consisting principally of tea, coffee

69103232
69115128

Ford Motor Company ..............
The Coca-Cola Company 
Aktiebolaget Fructus Fabriker ... 
Societe Des Produits Nestle S.A.

14.3.80
28.4.80
21.8.79
12.2.80

69126246
69133964

4465 6922 Chocolate,
tionery and sugar
of tea, coffee or cocoa, ,

and preparations included in Class 30 for making soups.
included in Class 16 except typewriters, addressing machines, franking machines 

of all such goods, and except type, printers overlays and bookbinding materials.

69234426

or cocoa,
All goods 

and parts
Candles, common soap, detergents; illuminating, heating or lubricating oils; matches; and 

starch, blue and other preparations for laundry purposes.
Tobacco whether manufactured or unmanufactured.
Tobacco whether manufactured or unmanufactured.
Tobacco whether manufactured or unmanufactured.

Ladybird Books Limited10.3.8069254828

Proctor & Gamble Limited22.2.8069262066

British-American Tobacco Company, Limited 
British-American Tobacco Company, Limited 
British-American Tobacco Company, Limited
Philip Morris Incorporated .......................
Kohler Co.............................................................
Reckitt & Colman (Overseas) Limited

24.11.79
24.11.79

13.2.80
15.5.80
29.4.80
26.6.80

69294064
69304065
69313645 Manufactured tobacco.

Installations for generating electric current.
Pharmaceutical, veterinary and sanitary preparations; medicated P^I™* finsecticide?

ment of the scalp and skin; deodorants; air freshening preparations, insecticide; 
disinfectants (other than for laying and absorbing dust), germicides and antiseptics, 
infants’ and invalids’ foods; dietetic foods; medicated beverages and preparations in

making such beverages, all being goods for export except to the

69503952
6953a5893
69586370

eluded in Class 5 for 
Irish Republic.

Foodstuffs for animals, and animal litter.
Pharmaceutical preparations and substances for human use and for veterinary use.
Non-medicated toilet preparations; cosmetic preparations; perfumes; soaps;

preparations for the hair; anti-perspirants; all being goods for sale m the United Kingdom 
and for export to the Republic of Ireland, and the Channel Islands.

Mars Limited ..........................
Glaxo Operations UK Limited ... 
Chesebrough-Pond’s Limited

14.8.80 
4.7.80

19.6.80

69666592
69676742
69736640

Cigarettes, tobacco and cigars.
Cigarettes.
All goods included in Class 29.
Hydraulic fluids (not being oils).
Wall boards made of woven or matted vegetable fibre.

Carreras Limited.............
Carreras Limited.............
Batchelors Foods Limited
Castrol Limited .............
Celotex Limited .............

12.8.79
6.6.79
2.4.80

17.3.80
21.7.80

69765760
69776646
69793705
69816475
69862903

I



o>

Effective 
date of 
renewal

Rcgistra- Renewal 
tion No No. Proprietor Description of Goods

563-1 6991 12.7.80 Standard Oil Company of California
Paints, varnishes, lacquers; preservatives against rust and against deterioration of wood-

mordan,s; na,ural rcsins: mc'als in foil and powder form
,n^S‘ri,alv“Is and TT (0thCr than. edible oiis and fa,s and esscmio1 oils)! lubricants; 

candlcsf tapcrsfnSSlJte ra0‘°r SPirit) 3"d iHuminantS;

Aanv0eood'«;nCofUClhn £ U- b^ n°l inc!uding sweetening materials and not including
any goods of the same description as sweetening materials.

Tobacco whether manufactured
Scotch Whisky.

Dl?Ie!Lf00df arn?u di£tCli<; bcverases; infants' and invalids’ foods; none being for export 
Bahrain C °P C S RCPUbliC °f Southcrn Yemen formerly known as Aden, or to

Standard Oil Company of California ...5636 6992 12.7.80

Standard Oil Company of California ...5639 6993 12.7.80

Brown & Williamson Tobacco Corporation (Export) Limited
White Horse Distillers Limited.............................................................
Societe Des Produits Nestle S.A.

3680 6995 20.4.80
14.1.81 
31.5.80

or unmanufactured.6015 6996
6019 6997

3842 N.V. Philips’ Gloeilampenfabrickcn7001 13.10.80

t,jb“(nonc bcins boiier tubcs °r partsstructures.
Hand tools hand instruments included in Class 8. cutlery, forks and spoons; shaving instru

ments. and parts and fittings included in Class 8 for the aforesaid goods.
All goods included in Class 10.

3844 N.V. Philips’ Gloeilampenfabriekcn ...7002 13.10.80

3847 7003 N.V. Philips’ Gloeilampcnfabrickcn 
N.V. Philips’ Gloeilampenfabrieken

13.10.80
13.10.803849 7004

Sclcded in ClLsnid.mStrUCt'°na teaChing matCrial (°ther than aPPar«us). brushes 
Food for cats.6854 7010 11.9.79

23.12.80
Mars Limited 
RCA Corporation3993 7011

f2c ‘ f sound-recordin8 and sound reproducing instruments and apparatus; radio and 
television receivers and kits of parts sold complete for making radio and television 
receiving sets; electrical apparatus for use in the tape control of television 
electronic tubes and transistors; , apparatus;

tape sound-recording and reproducing machines; etc.

Note : Where the description of goods is particularly lengthy it is not set out at length and the expression
of the goods. The full description “etc” 18 added after a description sufficient to indicate the general nature 

be ascertained from the original registration in the office of the Registrar General.can



7

FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol XCI 18 FEBRUARY 1982 No. 2

Appointment
Sir Peter Watkin Williams, Judge of the 

Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands, 1.1.82 to 
8.7.83.

HANDLEY, Robert 
HURST. Graham Leslie 
PARKER. Richard Hugh

Mid wives
BENNETT, Valerie Elizabeth s.r.n., s.c.m. 
GANT, Jacqueline Jean

b.sc., m.b., ch.B. (Sheffield) 
M.B., ch.B.
M.A., M.B., B.Ch.I

Acting Appointments
Gerald Winston Cheek, Acting Director of Civil 

Aviation, 3.6.80 - 31.10.81.
Mrs. Valerie Elizabeth Bennett, Acting Matron, 

Medical Department, 3.2.82.

S.R.N.. R.S.C.N., S.C.M..
N.N.E.B.

KILMARTIN. Dinah May 
TIMBERLAKE, Karen Lois 
WILLIAMS. Bronwen Vaughan s.r.n., s.c.m.

Dentists
HAINES. Daniel Hugo 
WATSON. Robert Muir

S.R.N., S.C.M.
S.R.N., S.C.M., D.N. Cert.

Promotion
Gerald Winston Cheek, from Air Traffic Con

troller to Director of Civil Aviation, 1.11.81.
B.D.S., L.D.S., R.C.S. 
L.D.Sif R.C.S.

i

Ref. MED/7/3.Completion of Contract
Richard Cain, Teacher, Education Department, 

3.11.81.

i

22nd January 1982.
Marriage Ordinance (Cap. 43) (Section 5)

The following are registered as Ministers for
celebrating marriages —
The Right Reverend Richard S. Cutts, Commis

sary in the Falkland Islands of the Archbishop 
of Canterbury.

The Reverend Harry Bagnall, Rector, Christ 
Church Cathedral.

Doctor Daniel Hugo Haines, Deacon, Christ 
Church Cathedral.

The Right Rev. Monsignor Daniel Spraggon, 
m.b.e., Prefect Apostolic of the Falkland Islands 
and Dependencies.

No. 4.
Re-appointment

Richard Cain, Teacher, Education Department, 
19.1.82.

NOTICES
22nd January 1982.No. 3.

Medical Practitioners, Midwives and Dentists Ordinance 
(Cap. 45) Section 4

The following have been registered to practise 
in the Colony and Dependencies —
Medical Practitioners 
BLEANEY, Alison Ann 
BRIDGMAN, Stephen Adrian m.b., ch.B.
GREEN, Martin William 
HAINES, Daniel Hugo 
HAINES, Hilary Margaret

Qualifications 
M.B., ch.B. (Aberdeen)

M.A., M.B., B.Ch.
The Reverend Father Augustine Monaghan, 

Priest, St. Mary's Church.
L.R.C.P., M.R.C.S.. D.R.C.O.C. 
L.R.C.P., M.R.C.S., M.B., B.S., 

D.P.H., M.F.C.M. Ref. INT/39/1.



I

8

No. 5. 28th January 1982. 28th January 1982.
In accordance with the provisions of Section 8 

(2) of the Livestock Ordinance (Cap. 40) notice is 
hereby given that the earmark known as a “T Back
bit” has been approved and registered in the name 
of Mr. Ian Butler of Section 3, Roy Cove.

A. B. Monk, 
Agricultural Officer,

Ref. AGR/10/2.

No. 7.
School Terms 1982

Stanley Schools and all recognised full-time 
schools in Camp 

15 th February to 12th May 
2nd Term — 3rd June to 25th August 
3rd Term — 16th September to 15th December.

There will be no half-term holidays except for one 
day only for children in reception classes, at the discretion 
of the head teacher.

The new Regulations regarding the school year will 
come into force during the 1st term. In future the 1st term 
will commence during the first week in February.

1st Term

No. 9. 4th February 1982.
With reference to Gazette Notice No. 3 of 22nd 

January 1982 the following name is hereby added 
to the list of Medical Practitioners, Midwives and 
Dentists registered to practise in the Colony and 
Dependencies in accordance with Section 4 of the 
Medical Practitioners, Midwives and Dentists Ord
inance.

Public Holidays in Stanley 1982 
These apply to Stanley schools and Camp 

Settlement schools.
Good Friday ...
Her Majesty the Queen’s 

Birthday
October Bank Holiday

Friday, 9th April

Wednesday, 21st April 
Monday, 4th October

Anniversary of the Battle of the 
Falkland Islands

Medical Practitioner 
Elphinstone, Mary

Qualifications 
m.b. b.s. (London) 

Ref. MED/7/3.

Wednesday, 8th December.

Recognised Camp Teachers 
Tuition shall take place except during the 

following periods —
(a) 19th December 1981 - 11th January 1982;
(b) One week to coincide with annual Camp

Sports or given station holiday in lieu of 
Sports Meeting;

(c) 9th April - Good Friday;
(d) One week to coincide with Traditional May

Ball week;
(e) 16th - 22nd August;
(f) 8th December - Battle Day.
The school year shall end on 15th December 

John A. T. Fowler, 
Superintendent of Education.

Ref. EDU/21/1.

No. 10. 4th February 1982. 
Public Health Ordinance (Cap. 54)

The following have been appointed members of 
the Board of Health for the Colony until 31st 
December 1982 —

The Senior Medical Officer - Chairman
The Medical Officers
The Hon. A. T. Blake
The Hon. T. J. Peck, c.p.m.
The Chief Police Officer 
The Director of Public Works.

1982.

Ref. MED/19/1.

28th January 1982.No. 6.
No. 11. 8th February 1982. 

Public Health Ordinance Section 54.
The following have been appointed to be the 

Hospital Visiting Committee for the year 1982 — 
The Reverend H. Bagnall (Chairman)
Mrs. Ruth Blyth 
Mrs. Janet Cheek.

In accordance with the provisions of Section 8 
(2) of the Livestock Ordinance (Cap. 40) notice is 
hereby given that the earmark known as a “Fork” 
has been approved and registered in the name of 
Mr. Marshall Barnes of Unit No. 2, Dunbar Section, 
Roy Cove.

A. B. Monk, 
Agricultural Officer,

Ref. MED/19/2.Ref. AGR/10/2.

3rd February 1982.No. 8
Grant of Wreck

It is notified for general information that the following Grant of Wreck has been made — 
Name of Vessel 

COQUIMBANA
Position 

Tyssen Patch

To whom Granted 
Mr. D. J. Eynon

Expiry Date

31 si December 1983

Ref. CUS/7/2.

■

!

;



9

EDUCATION ORDINANCE 1967

School (Amendment) Regulations 1982

No. 1 of 1982. R. M. HUNT, 
Governor.

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 16 of the 
Education Ordinance 1967, the Governor in Council has made the 
following regulations —

1. These regulations may be cited as the School (Amendment) 
Regulations 1982 and shall be deemed to have come into operation on 
the 1st day of January 1982.

Citation and commence
ment.

2. Regulation 4 of the principal regulations is revoked and 
replaced by the following —

Replacement of regulation
4.

4. (1) For recognised Stanley schools, the school 
year shall be of three terms, the first of fourteen weeks, 
the second of twelve weeks and the third of thirteen 
weeks duration, so arranged to allow a holiday of three 
weeks in June, three weeks in September and seven 
weeks, commencing with and including, the Thursday 
of the week preceding the week in which Christmas 
day occurs; such dates to be notified by publication in 
the Gazette.

"School terms 
and holidays.

(2) A mid-term holiday not exceeding one day in 
duration may be granted in each term to children in the 
reception classes of the Infant School at the discretion 
of the Headmaster.

(3) Recognised schools in Camp shall take the 
same holidays as Stanley schools, though the Super
intendent may authorise changes in these dates to 
coincide with farm holidays if so petitioned by farm 
managers, provided that such alternative arrangements 
do not reduce the total number of days worked in the 
year.”.

Made by the Governor in Council this 3rd day of February 1982.

R. Browning,
Clerk of Councils.

Ref. EDU/10/1.



10

WAGES AGREEMENT
The following agreement has been reached between the Government, the Falkland Islands Co., 

Ltd., and the General Employees’ Union. The agreement shall be effective for a period of nine mouths 
from 1st January 1982 and shall apply to the hourly paid employees of Government and the Falkland 
Islands Co., in Stanley.

1. Basis of Wage Rates.

Wages shall be adjustable by negotiation except that any changes arising from fluctuations in 
the cost of living, except as provided below, shall be automatic and date from the first day of the month 
following the quarter to which a review relates.

In measuring the cost of living for the purpose of wage adjustments an average of the findings of 
the last four preceding quarters shall be used. If however in any quarter the Index should exceed the 
average figure for the last four quarters by six points then the excess points will be taken into immediate 
account for the cost of living award. The payment in respect of the excess points will be adjusted as 
necessary, in future quarterly reviews of the cost of living.

N.B. When calculating the advance payment in excess of the first six points, Ip advance will be made in any case 
where the excess not already taken into accountlreaches one point.

For the period of this short-term agreement adjustments in wages arising from automatic cost of 
living awards shall be at the rate of 50% of the amount normally awarded under the Cost of Living 
Award Scheme and shall apply to all employees coming within the scope of the Agreement including 
apprentices and young labourers.

In addition to the wages payable for the period of this shorter agreement a temporary wage 
supplement of £2 per week shall be payable to full time employees who were not in receipt of £1.35 
per hour at the 31st December 1981. This temporary wage supplement shall not apply to the following 
employees —

1. Under 18 years of age.
2. On regular overtime.
3. Benefiting from contracts e.g. Jetty Contracts.
4. Apprentices.
5. Working wives and their husbands.
6. Pensioners and Old Age Pensioners.
7. Domestic servants in receipt of board and lodging from their employers.

(a) Craftsmen.
All Craftsmen shall be paid at the full basic rate and the following trades shall be 

recognised :—
Carpenters and Joiners 
Blacksmiths 
Painters
Motor Mechanics

The normal entry to a trade shall be by a full term of apprenticeship, but special 
arrangements shall be made for the absorption of men already practising trades without 
previously serving apprenticeships. These arrangements are laid down in the apprenticeship 
regulations.

Handymen.

Masons
Plumbers
Electricians

(b)
This term includes those employees doing skilled or semi-skilled work in one or more 

trades, but who have not served an apprenticeship nor have been recognised by the Apprentice
ship Board.

(c) Slaughtermen and Lorry Drivers.
Slaughtermen shall be provided with suitable protective clothing and footwear.
All drivers of petrol, steam or diesel engines, whether stationary or mobile, shall be paid 

for all working hours of the day on which the employee drives, irrespective of the period 
during which he is actually driving.

2. Prevailing Rates.
Class

1. Tradesmen
2. ’Apprentices

Hourly Rate. 
£1.53* 
£1.17* 
£1.19 
£1.22* 
£1.26* 
£1.35*

1st year 
2nd year 
3rd year 
4th year 
5th year

• An apprenticeship should not commence before the 15th birthday.

3. Handymen (according to ability)
4. Slaughtermen and tradesmen’s mates
5. Lorry Drivers, including men tending stationary engines or boilers
6. Tractor Drivers

£1.32* to £1.42* 
£1.31 
£1.32* 
£1.35*



11

7. Labourers Hourly Rate. 
£l.07jp 
£1.12 
£1.18 
£1.23 
£1.30

£l.53i 
£1.34 to £1.44

Age
14- 15
15- 16
16- 17
17- 18
18 and over

8. Plant Operator or Fitter Grade I (p.a.t.a.)

9. Plant Operator or Fitter Grade II (p.a.t.a.)

The above hourly rates are minimum and employers may, if they so wish, offer higher rates, 
incentive bonuses, etc.

Casual Labour. There is now no work which justifies a casual labour rate.

3. Extra Payments.
(a) “Dirt” Money.

As a general guide, “Dirt” money should only be paid when the work in hand is sub
stantially dirtier than the work which an employee is normally called upon to do. The precise 
rate for each job shall be agreed between Employer and Employees except that the following 
jobs shall automatically qualify for 19p per hour: Handling - cement in bags, filtration plant 
chemicals, gas oil, all drummed fuel, tar or bitumen, fertilisers; and crushing stone, or cleaning 
blocked sewers, oil burners and central heating appliances.

“Dirt” money shall be adjusted annually to take into account cost of living awards made 
during the course of the last four quarters.

(b) Hazardous Work.
Employees working on isolated structures, such as masts, at heights over 20 feet from 

the ground or where the structure joins the main roof of a building, shall be paid from 8p to 
lop per hour according to the risk involved. This does not apply to work on properly erected 
scaffolding or on roofs where the work can be carried out from a position where the workman’s 
feet are on a secured ladder.

(c) Inconvenience Pay.
Employees required, by the employer, to carry their midday meal shall receive 25p per 

day. Employees required to sleep away from home in a recognised camp house or cook-house 
shall have their board and lodgings paid for by their employer.

(d) Extra Skill or Responsibility.
(i) Any employee specifically detailed to supervise the work of three or more other 

employees shall receive 3p per hour extra while taking this responsibility.
(ii) Any labourer employed on semi-skilled work which would normally fall to a Handy

man (e.g. painting, fencing, concrete laying) shall receive pay as a Handyman while engaged 
this work. The precise rate shall be fixed by the employer according to the nature of the work 
and the skill of the particular labourer so employed. This will also apply to tallymen.

(e) Paint Spraying.

on

Employees engaged on paint spraying shall be paid 5p per hour extra and no other
allowance.

(f) Tool Allowance.
A tool allowance of £12 per annum is payable at the commencement of each year to any 

tradesman or handyman who is required to provide his own tools and who has completed one year’s 
continuous service with his employer. This allowance will not be paid where the necessary tools to 
carry out the duties are provided by the employer.

4. Working Hours.
The normal working hours shall be 40 hours per week made up as follows-

Monday to Friday - 7.30 a.m. to 4.30 p.m. with Dinner break from noon till 1 p.m.
A refreshment break of fifteen minutes shall be allowed between 08.30 and 09.30 a.m., the 

precise time being laid down by the employer.
Other hours of work may be laid down by mutual agreement between employers and 

employees, provided that the total number of hours does not exceed 40 per week.

5. Overtime.

(a) Overtime shall be paid for all hours 
shall be as follows-

worked outside normal working hours and overtime rates

Time and a Half.

<■> b""" “»*"<i p..«- w.,„«......»
(ii) From 6 a.m. to the 

before 6 a.m.



12

Double Time.
(i) Between midnight and (3 a.in.

From 6 a.m. to the start of the normal working day, if work commenced before 6 a.m. 
On Sundays and recognised Public Holidays.
For meal hours or parts thereof, if work continues through the normal working day 
without a full meal-hour break.

(v) Double time rates shall also be paid during normal working hours if, exceptionally, 
an employee starts work before midnight and continues without a break into normal 
working hours. Double time rates shall then continue to apply until there is an 
(unpaid) break from work exceeding four hours, after which the normal rates will 
again apply.

Stand-by Time

If a person is asked to turn out at week-ends he shall be paid stand-by time between 
the hours of 7.30 a.m. and 4.30 p.m. Stand-by time will cease as soon as work commences.

Stand-by time will be paid at the rate of time and a half for Saturdays and double 
time for Sundays.

An unpaid meal hour shall be allowed at a reasonable time if overtime is expected to continue 
for more than two hours beyond normal finishing time, and a paid refreshment break of not 
more than fifteen minutes shall be allowed in each subsequent 4-hour period.
Overtime is voluntary and an employee shall not be dismissed if he objects to working outside 
normal working hours. However, certain jobs may require attendance at times outside the 
normal hours and in these cases employees shall be given the option of a 40-hour week by 
allowing time off during normal working hours, at a time to be agreed with the employer.

(ii)
(hi)
(iv)

(b)

(c)

6. Public Holidays.

In addition to receiving double time for working on a public holiday employees shall be entitled 
to 8 hours holiday.

7. Holidays.

(a) Annual Holidays.

All employees shall be entitled to accumulate holidays at the rates and to the maximum 
hereinafter set out, namely —

Employees who have not completed three years’ service with their employer — 
Earning rate 'per month of continuous service 

10 hours

Employees who have completed three years’ service with their employer —
Earning rate per month of continuous service 

12 hours
In the event of an employee terminating his service prior to the completion of the first 

six months of service he shall forfeit any holiday entitlement not taken.

The maximum of 320 hours referred to above shall not apply to any excess over that 
amount accumulated as at 31st December 1970.

Paid holidays may be taken at a time to be mutually agreed upon.

(b) Public Holidays.

These are days on which Government Offices are closed by notification in the Gazette and 
the following eight days shall be paid holidays for all employees :-
New Year’s Day, Good Friday, The Queen’s Birthday and Commonwealth Day, October Bank 
Holiday, Anniversary of Battle of Falkland Islands, Christmas Day, Boxing Day, and one 
other day to coincide with the Annual Stanley Sports Meeting.

(c) Any allowance or special rates earned on both the working day preceding and the working day 
following the holiday shall be paid for the holiday.

(d) When a dated holiday falls on a Saturday or a Sunday the next working day shall be the 
holiday.

Maximum accumulation 
320 hours

■»-

Maximum accumulation 
320 hours

4

8. Sick Pay.
Employees who have not completed three months’ service with their employer shall not be 
entitled to sick pay.

If sickness lasts for more than two working days an employee shall be entitled to the following 
sick pay commencing on the first day of sickness on the production of a medical certificate-

(i) Employees who have completed three months’ service with their employer- 
Full pay for the first three weeks.
Half pay for the fourth and fifth weeks.

(a)

(b)



13

(ii) Employees who have completed three vears’ service with their employer - 
Full pay for the first six weeks.
Half pay for the following twelve weeks.

(c) Full pay shall be paid for any Public Holiday which falls during the first six weeks of sickness, 
provided that the employee, when he has recovered, returns to work for the same employer.

(d) An employer may demand a medical certificate before making any payment in respect of sick 
pay.

(e) The Workmen’s Compensation Ordinance shall apply in cases of sickness resulting from 
accidents at work. The Foreman and the Union Delegate must confirm in writing any accident 
at work.

9. Termination of Employment.

Except in the case of misdemeanour, when an employee may be summarily dismissed, the 
following notice of termination of employment shall be given-

(i) Employees who have completed ten years’ service with their employer-
One months notice.

(ii) Employees who have completed five years’ service with their employer-
Two weeks’ notice.

(iii) All other employees-
One week’s notice.

If desired employers may pay wages in (i), (ii) or (iii), as appropriate, in lieu of giving notice.

10. General.

(a) When a party of employees are required to carry meals to their work, one employee shall be 
allowed reasonable time to heat meals for the rest of the party.

(b) Individual employers may lay down the times when employees shall appear for their wages, 
provided that the payment is completed within ten minutes of the end of the normal working 
day.

(c) An official or delegation of a recognised union may, with the employer’s consent, attend at a 
job or shop at any time to interview workmen, but no meeting shall take place in working hours 
without the express permission of the employer. If a dispute arises, the employer or his 
nominee shall interview, by appointment, any official representative of his employees.

(d) All employers shall display for the benefit of their employees copies of Regulations and Rules 
pertaining to wages and conditions of service of workers.

(e) All employers shall ensure that tractors are fitted with safety cabs.

Ref. TRE/2/9



)

Printed at the Government Printing Office, Stanley, Falkland Islands. 
Price : Fourteen pence.



15

FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol XC1 26 MARCH 1982 No. 3

Appointment
Steven Thompson, Electrician, Public Works 

Department, 8.3.82. (On probation)
Acting Appointments

Donald Hugh McMillan, Acting Chief Police 
Oflicer, 28.12.79 - 21.9.81.

Michael Luxton, Acting Deputy Financial Sec
retary, Treasury Department, 18.4.81 - 28.2.82.

Miss Linda Margaret Lyse, Assistant Secretary 
(Finance) Treasury Department, 18.4.81 - 28.2.82.

Leslie Sidney Harris, Acting Electrical Super
intendent, Public Works Department, 27.5.81 - 
13.10.81.

Promotion
Derek Frank Howatt, Income Tax Officer, 

Treasury Department to Deputy Financial Sec
retary, Treasury Department, 1.3.82.

Transfers
Anthony John Bryson, Constable, Police and 

Prisons Department to Storeman, Central Store, 
11.3.82.

Retirements
Donald Hugh McMillan, q.p.m., c.p.m.. In

spector, Falkland Islands Police Force, 13.3.82.
Francis Theodore Lellman, Teacher, Education 

Department, 19.3.82.
Stephen John Martin, Relief Magistrate, South 

Georgia, 14.4.81 - 23.11.81.
Stephen John Martin, Relief Magistrate, South 

Georgia, 6.3.82.

Completion of Contract
Mrs. Camilla Clarke, Telephone Operator, Posts 

and Telecommunications Department, 8.2.82.

Re-appointment
Mrs. Camilla Clarke, Telephone Operator, Posts 

and Telecommunications Department, 9.2.82.

Resumption of Duty
Peter R. Witty, Magistrate, South Georgia, 

24.11.81.



16

NOTICES 1982 is published for general information — 
Chief Inspector8th March 1982.

Intimation has been received from the Right 
Honourable the Secretary of State for Foreign 
and Commonwealth Affairs to the effect that Her 
Majesty will not be advised to exercise her power 
of disallowace in respect of the following Ordin
ances of the Colony —

No. 12.
Whole Falkland Area A. B. Monk, o.b.e., j.p.

Inspectors

Whole Falkland Area R. S. Whitley
(y elerinary Officer)

S. Miller, c.b.e., j.p.
0Chairman,

Hydatids Committee)Ref.TitleNo.
Supplementary Appropriation (197S-79)

Ordinance 19S0 TRE/14/13. 
Old Age Pensions (Amend.) Ord. 1980 TRE/2/1. 
Non-Contributory Old Age Pensions

(Amendment) Ordinance 1980 TRE/2/2. 
Family Allowances (Amend.) Ord. 19S0 TRE/10/1. 
Licensing (Amendment) Ord. 1980

3/S0 Stanley S. J. McKay 
H. J. Alazia
G. Halliday
K. S. Kilmartin
R. E. Binnie
D. Whitney
F. J. Ferguson
E. M. Goss
B. Hardcastle, j.p.
T. McMullen
S. Morrison
H. L. Whitney 
A. H. Davis 
A. T. Blake 
A. Jaffray
T. Clifton 
R. I. Larsen 
P. W. Short
C. Alazia
A. C. Miller
J. A. Berntsen 
W. R. McKay 
R. M. Pitaluga, o.b.e. 
R. J. Davis 
J. D. Barton, j.p.
G. R. Alazia 
R. Turner
L. Grant
R. W. Newman
O. R. Smith 
R. M. Lee
R. McCormick 
R. J. Cockwell, j.p.
H. J. Binnie 
N. Knight
D. P. Dunford
P. C. Robertson
L. Berntsen
C. McCallum 
R. J. Ferguson 
J. L. Short
J. Forster 
W. R. Luxton
F. Marsh 
T. McGhic
M. Barnes
B. K. Betts
D. Donelly 
R. B. Napier 
R. P. McGill 
W. C. McBeth
L. G. Blake, o.b.e., j.p. 
R. L. Hansen 
A. R. Pole-Evans
G. O. Evans 
R. Evans
A. T. Felton 
F. Hirtle 
R. C. Smith
E. T. Heathman
N. Watson
Mrs. T. Morrison 
P. Goss
C. Bundes.

4/SO
5/80

Fluff Cove ... 
Fitzroy6/SO

LEG/10/337/80
Income Tax (Amendment) (No. 2) Darwin Sections8/80

Ordinance 1980 INC/10/5.
LEG/10/23.Trespass (Amendment) Ord. 19S1 

Stanley Common (Amend.) Ord. 1981 LEG/10/23.
1/SI
2/81

Registration of U.K. Patents (Amendment) 
Ordinance 19S1

4/81
LEG/1/3.

Walker Creek 
Lively Island 
North Ann ...

Supplementary Appropriation (1979-80)
Ordinance 1981 TRE/14/I4.

AGR/10/6. 
POL/10/5.

6/81

Agricultural Loans Ordinance 1981 
Road Traffic (Amendment) Ord. 1981

7/81
8/81

Road Traffic (Amendment) (No. 2)9/81 Sea Lion Island 
Speedwell Island 
San Carlos ...

Ordinance 1981 POL/10/5.
Workmens Compensation (Amendment)

Ordinance 1981 LEG/10/1. 
Family Allowances (Amend.) Ord. 1981 TRE/10/1. 
Old Age Pensions (Amend.) Ord. 1981 TRE/2/1.
Non-Contributory Old Age Pensions

(Amendment) Ordinance 1981 TRE/2/2.
Estate Duty (Amendment) Ord. 1981 TRE/10/6.

10/SI

11/81
12/81
13/81

Port San Carlos

Douglas Station 
Salvador14/81

15/81 Road Traffic (Amendment) (No. 3)
Ordinance 1981 POL/10/5.

Teal InletRef. LEG/10/42.

Rincon Grande 
Port Louis ...
Green Patch Settlement 
Johnsons Harbour ... 
Port Howard

No. 13. 8th March 1982.
Intimation has been received from the Right 

Honourable the Secretary of State for Foreign 
and Commonwealth Affairs to the effect that Her 
Majesty will not be advised to exercise her power 
of disallowance in respect of the following Ordin
ances of the Dependencies —

Title

Fox Bay East

Ref.No. Fox Bay West
DS1/80 Application of Colony Laws

Ordinance 1980 LEG/10/37.
Port StephensDS 1/81 Application of Colony Laws

Ordinance 1981 LEG/10/37.
New Island ... 
Weddell Island Group

Ref. LEG/10/42.

17th March 1982.No. 14.
The Extradition (Tokyo Convention) (Amend

ment) Order 1982 (S.I. No. 149)
The Extradition (Genocide) (Amendment) 

(Order) 1982 (S.I. No. 145)
The Extradition (Hijacking) (Amendment) 

Order 1982 (S.I. No. 146)
The Extradition (Protection of Aircraft) 

(Amendment) Order 1982 (S.I. No. 148)
The Extradition (Internationally Protected 

Persons) (Amendment) Order 1982 (S. I. No. 147)

Dunnose Head 
Chartres

Roy Cove Settlement 
Roy Cove Section 2 
Roy Cove Section 4 
Roy Cove Section 5 
West Point Island .. 
Carcass Island 
Sedge Island 
Hill Cove ................

It is notified for general information that the 
abovenamed Orders made by Her Majesty the 
Queen in Council amend principal Orders which 
are applicable to the Colony and Dependencies, 
and copies may be seen at the Chief Secretary’s 
Office during normal office hours.

Saunders Island 
Pebble Island

Beaver I slat id 
Golding Island 
Port Howard (Packes) 
Eslancia 
Long Island 
Brookfield 
Horseshoe Bay 
Sparrow Cove

LEG/10/22C.

20th March 1982.

Hydatid Eradication (Dogs) Order 198!
(Under Section 12a of the Dogs Ordinance, Cap. 21) 
The following list of Inspectors as at 1st March

No. 15.

i

Ref. AGR/7/16.



17

24 th March 1982.No. 18.24th March 1982.No. 16.
Harbour Ordinance (Cap. 30)

(Section 4)

In accordance with Section 4 of the Harbour 
Ordinance (Cap. 30) as applied to the Dependencies 
by the Application of Colony Laws Ordinance, 
Cap 1. (D.S.), His Excellency the Governor has 
been pleased to appoint —

Mr. Stephen John Martin

to be Harbour Master for Cumberland East Bay, 
South Georgia, with effect from 6th March 1982.

Ref. CUS/10/3.

Immigration Ordinance 1965
(Section 3)

In accordance with Section 3 of the Immigration 
Ordinance 1965, as applied to the Dependencies by 
the application of Colony Laws Ordinance 1965, 
His Excellency the Governor has been pleased to 
appoint —

Mr. Stephen John Martin

to be Immigration Officer for South Georgia with 
effect from 6th March 1982.

Ref. IMM/10/1.

Customs Ordinance (Cap. 16)
No. 17. 24lh March 1982.

In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 
4 of the Customs Ordinance (Cap. 16) I hereby 
appoint —

Immigration Ordinance 1965
(Section 3)

In accordance with Section 3 of the Immigration 
Ordinance 1965, His Excellency the Governor has 
been pleased to appoint —

Mr. Ronald G. W. Lamb

Mr. Stephen John Martin 
to be a Deputy Collector of Customs at Cumberland 
East Bay, South Georgia, with effect from the 6th 
March 1982.

to be Immigration Officer for the Colony with effect 
from 22nd September 1981.

L. J. Halliday, 
Collector of Customs.IRef. IMM/10/1. 24th March 1982.

No. 19. 26th March 1982.

Grants of Wreck
It is notified for general information that the following Grants of Wreck have been made —

To whom Granted 
Mr. D. J. Eynon 
Mr. D. J. Eynon

Name of Vessel 
Afterglow 
Philomel

Position

Stanley Harbour 
Stanley Harbour

Expiry Date

31st March 1987 
31st March 1987

Ref. CUS/7/2.

=>
-
—

-—



18

Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 18th day of March 1982.

R. M. HUNT, 
Governor.

No. DS 1 1982

Falkland Islands Dependencies

IN THE THIRTY-FIRST YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.
Rex Masterman Hunt, c.m.g.

Governor.

An Ordinance
To legalise certain payments made in the year 

1978-79 in excess of the expenditure sanctioned 

by Ordinance No. DS 4 of 1979.
WHEREAS it is expedient to make further provision for the 

service of the Falkland Islands Dependencies for the period first day 
of July 1978 to the thirtieth day of June 1979.

ENACTED for the Dependencies of the Colony of the Falkland 
Islands by the Governor of the Colony of the Falkland Islands and 
the Dependencies thereof, as follows —

1. This Ordinance may be cited for all purposes as the 
Supplementary Appropriation (Dependencies) (1978-79) Ordinance 
1981.

Title.

Preamble.

Short title

2. The sums of money set forth in the Schedule hereto
expenditure for the period having been expended for the services therein mentioned beyond the 
1st July 1978 to 30th June b r J
1979.

Appropriation of excess

amounts granted for those services by the Ordinance providing for 
the service for the period first day of July 1978 to the thirtieth day 
of June 1979, the same are hereby declared to have been duly laid 
out and expended for the service of the Dependencies in that period, 
and are hereby approved, allowed and granted in addition to the sum 
mentioned for those services in the said Ordinance.



19

SCHEDULE Schedule.

Head of Service Amount

South Georgia Expenditure
A. Personal Emoluments
B. Other Charges
C. Special Expenditure

48
15,444
3,356

£ 18,848

Promulgated by the Governor on the 18th day of March 1982.

F. E. Baker,
Chief Secretary.

Ref. SG/14/7.



20

HARBOUR ORDINANCE
(Chapter 30)

Harbour (Amendment) Regulations 1982

No. 2 of 1982. R. M. HUNT, 
Governor.

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the 
Harbour Ordinance, the Governor in Council has made the following 

regulations —

1. These regulations may be cited as the Harbour (Amend
ment) Regulations 1982 and shall be deemed to have come into 
operation on the 1st day of July 1981.

2. Schedule III to the principal regulations is amended by 
deleting paragraph (1) of Item 1 and substituting the following —

“(1) The following harbour dues shall be payable on all vessels 
arriving in the Colony —

Citation and commence
ment.

Amendment of Schedule
III.

(Cap. 30 sub. leg.)

£
FreeYachts ... 

Vessels under 
Vessels of over 
Vessels of over 
Vessels of over 
Vessels of over

15 tons ...
15 tons and up to
50 tons and up to

500 tons and up to
800 tons and up to 1,000 tons

Vessels of over 1,000 tons and up to 1,500 tons
Vessels of over 1,500 tons and up to 2,000 tons
Vessels of over 2,000 tons and up to 5,000 tons
Vessels of over 5,000 tons and up to 7,000 tons
Vessels of over 7,000 tons and up to 10,000 tons
Vessels of over 10.000 tons and up to 15,000 tons
Vessels of over 15,000 tons and up to 20,000 tons
Vessels of over 20,000 tons ...
Locally registered vessels normally employed in trading ..

Free
50 tons 

500 tons 
800 tons

96
120

132
168

192
240

288

360
540

660
780

I
900

Free”.

Made by the Governor in Council this 3rd day of March 1982.

R. Browning,
Clerk of Councils.

Ref. CUS/10/3.



21

FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

7 JULY 1982Vol. XC1 No. 4

Henry John Bonner, Officer-in-Charge, Public 
Works Department, 3.3.82 - 25.6.82.

Derek Stanley Evans, Acting Headmaster, In
fant/Junior School, 26.6.82.

Promotion
William Andrew Nutt Goodwin, Mate/Engineer, 

m. v. Forrest to Master, m. v. Forrest, with effect 
from 1.7.82.

Appointment
Peter Julian Biggs, Income Tax Officer, Treasury 

Department, 29.3.82. On probation.
Confirmation of Appointment 

Peter Coutts, Carpenter, Public Works Depart
ment, 29.4.80.

Acting Appointments
Miss Shelley Livermore, Acting Clerk/Store

keeper, Medical Department, 1.4.82.
Mrs. Valerie Elizabeth Bennett, Acting Matron, 

Medical Department, 3.2.82 - 20.7.82.

Resignation
James Burgess, Storeman, Central Store, 27.3.82.



22

PROCLAMATION
No. 1 of 1982

In the name of Her Majesty ELIZABETH II, by the Grace of God of the United 
Kingdom of Great Britain and Northern Ireland and of Her other Realms and Territories 
Queen, Head of the Commonwealth, Defender of the Faith.

By His Excellency REX MASTERMAN HUNT, Esquire, Companion of the Most 
Distinguished Order of Saint Michael and Saint George, Civil Commissioner for the Colony 
of the Falkland Islands and its Dependencies.

WHEREAS it is provided by subsection (1) of section 24 of the Falkland Islands (Legis
lative Council) Orders 1948 to 1977 that the sittings of the Legislative Council shall be held 
at such times and places as the Civil Commissioner shall from time to time appoint by proc
lamation published in the Gazette:

NOW, THEREFORE, I, REX MASTERMAN HUNT, do hereby Proclaim that the 
next sitting of the Legislative Council of the Falkland Islands shall be held at 9.30 o’clock 
in the forenoon of Wednesday, the 28th day of July 1982 at the Court and Council Chambers 
in the town of Stanley in the Falkland Islands.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the Colony of the Falkland Islands at 
Government House, Stanley, Falkland Islands this 6th day of July in the year of Our Lord 
One thousand Nine hundred and eighty-two.

R. M. HUNT, 
Civil Commissioner.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN

Ref. LEC/35/1. II.

i



23

A Bill for 

An Ordinance
To amend the Old Age Pensions Ordinance 1952.

(5th July 1982)

Title.

Date of commencement.

BE IT ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Enacting clause. 
Falkland Islands, as follows —

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Old Age Pensions 
(Amendment) Ordinance 1982 and shall be deemed to have come into 
operation on the 5th day of July 1982.

2. The Schedule to the principal Ordinance is amended by 
deleting “£19.50”, “£13.00”, “£13.00” and “£13.00” and substituting 
the following respectively —

“£22.00”, “£14.50”, “£14.50” and “£14.50”.

Short title and commence
ment.

Amendment of Schedule.

OBJECTS AND REASONS
The objects of this Bill are to increase the weekly pensions —

(a) for a married couple from £19.50 to £22.00; and
(b) for a single person from £13.00 to £14.50.

A Bill for 

An Ordinance
To amend the Non-contributory Old Age 

Pensions Ordinance 1961.
Title.

(5th July 1982) Date of commencement.

BE IT ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Enacting clause. 
Falkland Islands, as follows —

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Non-contributory short title and 
Old Age Pensions (Amendment) Ordinance 1982 and shall be deemed 
to have come into operation on the 5th day of July 1982.

commence
ment.

2. The Schedule to the principal Ordinance is amended by Amendment of schedule, 
deleting “£16.00”, “£12.00” and “£12.00” and substituting the fol
lowing respectively—

“£18.00”, “£13.50” and “£13.50”.

OBJECTS AND REASONS
The objects of this Bill are to increase Non-contributory Old Age Pensions —

(a) for a married couple from £16.00 to £18.00 per week; and
(b) for a single person from £12.00 to £13.50 per week.



24

A Bill for 

An Ordinance
To provide for the Public Service of the 

financial year ending the 30th day of June 1983.
(1st July 1982)

WHEREAS due to the recent occupation of the Colony by 
alien military forces the expenditure required for the service of the 
Colony for the financial year ending on the 30th day of June 1983 has 
been estimated provisionally at the sum of Three million, five hundred 
thousand pounds:

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ENACTED by the Legislature of 
the Colony of the Falkland Islands, as follows —

This Ordinance may be cited as the Appropriation (Pro
visional) Ordinance 1982.

2. A sum not exceeding One million, seven hundred and 
fourteen thousand pounds shall be and the same is hereby charged 
provisionally upon the revenue and other funds of the Colony for the 
service of the financial year commencing on the 1st day of July 1982, 
and ending on the 30th day of June 1983, and the said sum so charged 
may be expended in the manner expressed in the Schedule.

Title.

Date of commencement.

Preamble.

Enacting clause.

1.Short title.

Appropriation of 
£1.714.000 from the 
general revenues and other 
funds.



25

SCHEDULE Schedule.

Number HEAD OF SERVICE £

The Governor........................................
Agriculture ... ...............
Aviation
Customs and Harbour............................
Education ... ...............
Medical.....................................................
Meteorological
Military ............... ...............
Miscellaneous ...
Pensions and Gratuities
Police and Prisons
Posts and Telecommunications
Public Works ........................................
Public Works Recurrent
Public Works Special............................
Secretariat, Treasury and Central Store
Overseas Passages ............................
Social Welfare ............................
Supreme Court and Legal ...............
Training.....................................................

1. 21,000
14.000

142.000
28.000

128.000
135.000

9.000
4.000 

20,000
39.000
17.000

140.000
152.000
122.000
26.000
92.000
57.000
38.000
15.000 
5,000

II.
III.
IV.
V.

VI.
VII.

VIII.
IX.
X.

XI.
XII.

XIII.
XIV.
XV.

XVI.
XVII.

XVIII.
XIX.
XX.

... £ 1,204,000Total Ordinary Expenditure
Development A

Expenditure to be met from Colony funds ... 
Development B

Expenditure to be met from U.K. Aid

243,000

267,000

... £ 1,714,000Total Expenditure ...

Until the definitive Estimates for 1982/83 are prepared and approved 
expenditure is to be maintained, as far as possible, at the same level as in 
1981/82 Financial Year and applications for non-recurrent expenditure must 
receive the prior approval of the Standing Finance Committee.

Ref. TRE/14/18.



F
,

26

A Bill for 

An Ordinance
To amend the Income Tax Ordinance.Title.

(1st January 1982)Date of commencement.

BE IT ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the 
Falkland Islands, as follows —

Enacting clause.

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Income Tax (Amend
ment) Ordinance 1982 and shall be deemed to have come into 
operation on the 1st January 1982 and shall apply to assessment for 
the year of assessment commencing on the 1st January 1982 and to 
subsequent years of assessment.

2. Section 14 of the principal Ordinance is amended in 
subsection (1) by deleting “£1,200” and substituting the following —

“£1,500”.

Short title and commence
ment.

Amendment of section 14. 
(Cap. 32.)

T

3. Section 15 of the principal Ordinance is amended —Amendment of section 15.

in subsection (1) by deleting “£700” and substituting the 
following —

(a)

“£900”;
in subsection (2) by deleting “£400” and substituting the 
following —

(b)

“£500”;

in paragraph (a) of subsection (3), by deleting “£700” and 
“£400” and substituting the following respectively —

“£900” and “£500”; and

(c)

in subsection (4), by deleting “£1,200” and substituting the 
following —

(d)

‘£1,500”.
4. Section 16 of the principal Ordinance is amended —Amendment of section 16.

(a) in subsection (1) by deleting “£400” and substituting the 
following —

“£500”; and

(b) in paragraph (i) of the proviso to subsection (1), by deleting 
“£440” and substituting the following —

“£550”.

5. Section 16a of the principal Ordinance is amended by 
deleting “£2,350” wherever it occurs and substituting the following —

“£2,950”.

Amendment of section
16a.

1



27

OBJECTS AND REASONS
The effect of this Bill is —

to increase the maximum deduction in respect of earned income for 
a wife where a husband and wife are assessed jointly from £1,200 
to £1,500;

to increase the deduction for a wife from £700 to £900; 
to increase the allowance for a relative in charge of children from 
£400 to £500;

to increase the deduction for the maintenance of an infirm relative 
from £400 to £500 and raise the qualifying income limit of the 
infirm relative from £700 to £900:

to increase the personal allowance from £1,200 to £1,500; 
to increase the child allowance from £400 to £500; 
to increase the child allowance (educated overseas) from £440 to 
£550; and

to increase the limit up to which old age relief applies from £2,350 
to £2,950.

(a)

(b)
(c)

(d)

(e)
(f)
(S)

(h)



Printing Office, Stanley, Falkland Islands.
Price: Twenty-one pence.

Printed at the Government



29

FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

26 AUGUST 1982Vol XC1 No. 5

Acting Appointments
Miss Shelley Livermore, Acting Clerk/Store

keeper, Medical Department, 1.4.82 - 19.4.82.
James Stephenson, Acting Senior Forecaster, 

Meteorological Department, 13.4.82.
John David Peatfield, Acting Superintendent 

of Education, 17.7.82.
Miss Anna Constance Eve King, Acting Cashier, 

Treasury Department, 24.7.82.
Wallace Carlinden Hirtle, Acting Executive 

Officer, Secretariat, 30.7.82.

Appointments
Mrs. Melody Christine Betts, Infant Teachers 

Assistant, Education Department, 9.7.82. On pro
bation.

Dr. Bruce Marsden, Medical Officer, Medical 
Department, 23.7.82.

Confirmation of Appointments
Vernon Robert Steen, Engineer, Aviation De

partment, 12.3.80.
Kenneth William Halliday, Operator / Tech

nician, Fox Bay, 5.4.80.
Peter Coutts, Carpenter, Public Works Depart

ment, 29.4.80.
Miss Jacqueline Mary Stewart, Clerk, Public 

Service, 1.7.80.
Mrs. Rowena Summers, Clerk, Public Service, 

21.7.80.
Miss Stephanie Ann Coutts, Clerk, Public Ser

vice, 1.8.80.

Completion of Contract
Mrs. Janice Blackburn, Teacher, Education De

partment, 18.7.82.
Resignations

Steven Thompson, Electrician, Public Works 
Department, 9.4.82.

Miss Sonia Summers, Clerk, Public Service, 
31.7.82.

Temporary Appointment 
Robert Handley, Medical Officer, Medical De

partment, 26.6.82.

------------------------------  OBITUARY -----------------------------

It is with deep regret that His Excellency the 
Civil Commissioner announces the death on 11th 
June 1982 of Mrs. Susan Whitley, Teacher in the 
Education Department.

Re-appointment
Mrs. Sandra Clifton, Clerk, Public Service,

1.7.80. I



f
30

No. 20. 6th August 1982.
With reference to Gazette Notice No. 3 of 22nd 

January 1982 the following name is hereby added 
to the list of Medical Practitioners, Midwives and 
Dentists registered to practise in the Colony and 
Dependencies in accordance with Section 4 of the 
Medical Practitioners, Midwives and Dentists Ord
inance —

POLICE RESERVE OFFICERS
I, Captain Allan Keith Barley of the Royal 

Military Police, and the undermentioned persons 
do solemnly and sincerely declare and affirm that 
I/we will well and truly serve our Sovereign Lady 
The Queen in the office of Police Officer for the 
Colony without favour or affection malice or ill- 
will, and that I/we will to the best of my/our 
power cause the peace to be kept and prevent all 
offences against the persons and properties of Her 
Majesty’s subjects: and while I/we continue to 
hold the said office, I/we will to the best of my/ 
our skill and knowledge, discharge all the duties 
thereof faithfully according to law.

Captain Allan Barley 
Staff Sergeant Ondrc Shaw 
Staff Sergeant Michael Cooper 
Sergeant Steven May 
Sergeant Kevin Cox 
Sergeant John Burton 
Corpora! Sean Farrell 
Corporal Anthony Savage 
Corporal Malcolm Davies 
Corporal Michael Hunt 
Corporal Gareth John 
Corporal Brian Wilkinson 
Corporal Richard Lawn 
Lance Corporal Gary Needham 
Lance Corporal Melvin Cooper 
Lance Corporal Stephen Dowling 
Lance Corporal Mark Myles.

Police Reserve Officers

Declared before me this 25th day of June 1982.

H. Bennett,
Senior Magistrate

Medical Practitioners 
Marsden, Bruce

Qualifications 
M.B.. ch.B. (Viet) 

M.R.C.S., L.R.C.P.

Ref: MED/7/3.

No. 21. 11th August 1982.
1.Currency Notes Rules

In exercise of the powers conferred by rule 3 of 
the Currency Notes Rules, His Excellency the 
Civil Commissioner has been pleased to approve 
the appointment of Miss Anna Constance Eve 
King to be a currency officer with effect from 4th 
August 1982.

Miss King replaces Miss Pauline Sackett who 
ceased to be a currency officer on termination of 
service in the Treasury on 31.12.81.

H. T. Rowlands, 
Commissioner of Currency.

Ref. TRE/19/1.

2.
3.
4.
5.
6.
7.
8.
9.

10.

12.
13.
14.

No. 22. 12th August 1982. 
Hydatid Eradication (Dogs) Order 1981 

(Under Section 12a of the Dogs Ordinance, Cap. 21) 
His Excellency the Civil Commissioner has 

appointed the following person to be an Inspector 
for the purposes of this Order —

Major Brian Thompson, r.a.v.c. 
for the whole Falkland Islands Area.

15.
16.
17.

Ref: AGR/7/16.

13th August 1982. 
His Excellency the Civil Commissioner has been 

pleased to appoint —
Mr. Anthony Thomas Blake

No. 23. POLICE RESERVE OFFICERS

I, Major Anthony J. Figg of the Royal Mil
itary Police, and the undermentioned persons do 
solemnly and sincerely declare and affirm that I/we, 
will well and truly serve our Sovereign Lady The 
Queen in the office of Police Officer for the Colony 
without favour or affection malice or ill-will, and 
that I/we will to the best of my/our power cause 
the peace to be kept and prevent all offences 
against the persons and properties of Her Majesty's 
subjects, and while I/we continue to hold the said 
office I/we will to the best of my/our skill and 
knowledge, discharge all the duties thereof faith
fully according to law.

Major Anthony J. Figg 
Sergeant Major John Wilson 
Sergeant Major Peter Worrell 
Sergeant Roy Dodds 
Sergeant Colin Lovett 
Corporal Paul Crampton 
Corporal Michael Coulson 
Corporal Keith Garbett 
Corporal Richard Hardaker 
Lance Corporal David Griffin 
Lance Corporal Anthony Lane.

Declared before me on this 5th day of August

!of North Arm, to be a Registrar under Section 4 of 
the Marriage Ordinance (Cap. 43) for the purpose 
of celebrating the marriage of Donald William Betis, 
bachelor, and Shirley Rose Small, divorcee, both of 
North Arm, at North Arm.

;
i

Ref: LEG/19/2.

13th August 1982. 
His Excellency the Civil Commissioner has been 

pleased to appoint —
Mr. Anthony Thomas Blake

No. 24.

1.
2.of North Arm, to be a Registrar under Section 4 of 

the Marriage Ordinance (Cap. 43) for the purpose 
of celebrating the marriage of Robin Goodwin, 
divorcee, and Mandy Hazel Minnell, spinster, both 
of North Arm, at North Arm.

3.
4.I
5.
6.Ref: LEG/19/2.
7.
8.17th August 1982.

Hydatid Eradication (Dogs) Order 1981
(Under Section 12a of the Dogs Ordinance, Cap. 21) 
His Excellency the Civil Commissioner has 

appointed the following person to be an Inspector 
for the purposes of this Order —

Raymond Robson

No. 25.
9.

10.
11.

1982.
i

Port Louis.
Ref. AGR/7/16.

H. Bennett,
Senior Magistrate



31

POLICE OFFICER Probate
In the Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands

Notice under the Administration of Estates Ordinance 
(Cap. 1)

In the matter of Susan Whitley, deceased, of 
Stanley, Falkland Islands, who died at Stanley on 
the 12th day of June 1982, intestate.

Whereas Richard Stephen Whitley, husband of 
i the deceased has applied for Letters of Administra

tion to administer the estate of the said deceased 
in the Colony.

Notice is hereby given pursuant to section 4 
of the Administration of Estates Ordinance to all 
persons resident in the Colony who may have 
prior claim to such grant that the prayer of the 
Petitioner will be granted provided no caveat be 
entered in the Supreme Court within twenty-one 
days of the publication hereof.

I. Chief Superintendent William Richards of 
the Metropolitan Police Force, do solemnly and 
sincerely declare and affirm that I will well and 
truly serve our Sovereign Lady The Queen in the 
office of Police Officer for the Colony without 
favour or affection malice or ill-will, and that I 
will to the best of my power cause the peace to be 
kept and prevent all offences against the persons 
and properties of Her Majesty’s subjects, and while 
I continue to hold the said office, I will to the best 
of my skill and knowledge, discharge all the duties 
thereof faithfully according to law.

Chief Superintendent William Richards 
Declared before me on this 5th day of August

1982.
H. Bennett,

Senior Magistrate
H. Bennett, 
Registrar.POLICE RESERVE OFFICER Stanley,

Falkland Islands. 
20th August 1982.

I, Leading Regulator Kenneth John Davies and 
Leading Regulator Stephen Unwin of the Royal 
Naval Provost do solemnly and sincerely declare 
and affirm that I/we will well and truly serve our 
Sovereign Lady The Queen in the office of Police 
Officer for the Colony without favour or affection 
malice or ill-will and that I/we will to the best of 
my/our power cause the peace to be kept and 
prevent all offences against the persons and proper
ties of Her Majesty's subjects, and while I/we 
continue to hold the said office, I/we will to the 
best of my/our skill and knowledge, discharge all | 
the duties thereof faithfully according to law.

1. Leading Regulator Kenneth John Davies
2. Leading Regulator Stephen Unwin

Declared before me on this 5th day of August

SC & L/16/82.

In the Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands
Notice under the Administration of Estates Ordinance 

(Cap. I)
In the matter of Mary Ann Goodwin, de

ceased, of Stanley, Falkland Islands, who died at 
Stanley on the 15th day of June 1982, intestate.

Whereas William Andrew Nutt Goodwin, son 
of the deceased has applied for Letters of Adminis
tration to administer the estate of the said deceased 
in the Colony.

Notice is hereby given pursuant to section 4 
of the Administration of Estates Ordinance to all 
persons resident in the Colony who may have 
prior claim to such grant that the prayer of the 
Petitioner will be granted provided no caveat be 
entered in the Supreme Court within twenty-one 
days of the publication hereof.

1982.
H. Bennett,

Senior Magistrate.

POLICE RESERVE OFFICERS
I, Flight Sergeant Neville P. Goode of the Royal 

Air Force, and the undermentioned persons do ! 
solemnly and sincerely declare and affirm that I/we, 
will well and truly serve our Sovereign Lady The j 
Queen in the office of Police Officer for the Colony 
without favour or affection malice or ill-will, and 
that I/we will to the best of my/our power cause 
the peace to be kept and prevent all offences against j 
the persons and properties of Her Majesty’s sub
jects, and while I/we continue to hold the said 
office, I/we will to the best of my/our skill and 
knowledge, discharge all the duties thereof faith
fully according to law.

1. Flight Sergeant Neville P. Goode
2. Sergeant David W. Greer
3. Corporal James S. Murdoch
4. Corporal Jeffery R. Shat ford
5. Corporal Andrew Peacock
6. Corporal Neil Grant.

Declared before me on this 16th day of August

H. Bennett, 
Registrar.

Stanley,
Falkland Islands. 
20th August 1982.

SC &L/18/82.

Notice to Creditors, etc.
Re Joseph William Alazia, deceased, late of 

Stanley, Falkland Islands, who died at Stanley, 
Falkland Islands, on the 6th day of February 1982, 
testate.

i

Notice is hereby given that creditors and 
other persons having claims against the estate of 
the above named deceased should give notice there
of in writing to Harold Bennett sole executor of 
the Will of the said Joseph William Alazia not 
later than 30th day of October 1982 after which 
time the executor intends to distribute the estate 
of the said Joseph William Alazia among the 
parties entitled thereto having regard only to the 
claims of which notice has been then received by 
the said executor.
Stanley,
26th August 1982.

1982.
H. Bennett,
Senior Magistrate.

7. Regulating Petty Officer David E. Sims.
FI. Bennett,

Senior Magistrate.

i



32

Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 13th day of August 1982.

R. M. HUNT, 
Civil Commissioner.

1982No. 1

Colony of the Falkland Islands

IN THE THIRTY-FIRST YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.
Rex Masterman Hunt, c.m.g. 

Civil Commissioner.

An Ordinance
To provide for the Public Service of the 

financial year ending the 30th day of June 1983.
(1st July 1982)

Title.

Date of commencement.

WHEREAS due to the recent occupation of the Colony by 
alien military forces the expenditure required for the service of the 
Colony for the financial year ending on the 30th day of June 1983 has 
been estimated provisionally at the sum of Three million, five hundred 
thousand pounds:

NOW, THEREFORE, IT IS ENACTED by the Legislature of 
the Colony of the Falkland Islands, as follows —

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Appropriation (Pro
visional) Ordinance 1982.

2. A sum not exceeding One million, seven hundred and 
fourteen thousand pounds shall be and the same is hereby charged 
provisionally upon the revenue and other funds of the Colony for the 
service of the financial year commencing on the 1st day of July 1982, 
and ending on the 30th day of June 1983, and the said sum so charged 
may be expended in the manner expressed in the Schedule.

Preamble.

Short title.

Appropriation of 
£1.714.000 from the 
general revenues and other 
funds.



I 33

SCHEDULE Schedule.

Number HEAD OF SERVICE £

I. The Governor ...
Agriculture ............................
Aviation ...............
Customs and Harbour ...
Education
Medical.....................................................
Meteorological ............................
Military ........................................
Miscellaneous ...
Pensions and Gratuities 
Police and Prisons 
Posts and Telecommunications 
Public Works ...
Public Works Recurrent
Public Works Special............................
Secretariat, Treasury and Central Store 
Overseas Passages
Social Welfare ............................
Supreme Court and Legal ...............
Training ...

21,000
14.000

142.000
28.000

128.000
135.000

9.000
4.000 

20,000
39.000
17.000

140.000
152.000
122.000
26.000
92.000
57.000
38.000
15.000 
5,000

II.
Ill
IV.
V.

VI.
VII.

VIII.
IX.
X.

XI.
XII.

XIII.
XIV.
XV.

XVI.
XVII.

XVIII.
XIX.
XX.

Total Ordinary Expenditure ... £ 1,204,000
Development A

Expenditure to be met from Colony funds ... 
Development B

Expenditure to be met from U.K. Aid

243,000

267,000

... £ 1,714,000Total Expenditure ...

Until the definitive Estimates for 1982/83 are prepared and approved 
expenditure is to be maintained, as far as possible, at the same level as in 
1981/82 Financial Year and applications for non-recurrent expenditure must 
receive the prior approval of the Standing Finance Committee.
Ref. TRE/14/18.

Passed by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland Islands 
this 28th day of July 1982.

R. Browning, 
Clerk to the Councils.

This printed impression has been carefully compared by me 
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. Browning,
Clerk to the Councils.

i

:

i



34

Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 13th day of August 1982.

R. M. HUNT, 
Civil Commissioner.

No. 2 1982

Colony of the Falkland Islands

IN THE THIRTY-FIRST YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.
Rex Masterman Hunt, c.m.g. 

Civil Commissioner.

An Ordinance
To amend the Old Age Pensions Ordinance 1952.

(5th July 1982)

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland

Title.

Date of commencement.

Islands.

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Old Age Pensions 
(Amendment) Ordinance 1982 and shall be deemed to have come into 
operation on the 5th day of July 1982.

2. The Schedule to the principal Ordinance is amended by 
deleting “£19.50”, “£13.00”, “£13.00” and “£13.00” and substituting 
the following respectively —

“£22.00”, “£14.50”, “£14.50” and “£14.50”.

Short title and commence
ment.

Amendment of Schedule.

Passed by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland Islands 
this 28th day of July 1982.

R. Browning, 
Clerk to the Councils.

This printed impression has been carefully compared by me 
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. Browning,
Clerk to the Councils.



35

Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 13th day of August 1982.

R. M. HUNT, 
Civil Commissioner.

No. 3 1982

Colony of the Falkland Islands

IN THE THIRTY-FIRST YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.
Rex Masterman Hunt, c.m.g. 

Civil Commissioner.

An Ordinance
To amend the Non-contributory Old Age 

Pensions Ordinance 1961.
(5th July 1982)

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland

Title.

i Date of commencement.
I

Islands.

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Non-contributory 
Old Age Pensions (Amendment) Ordinance 1982 and shall be deemed 
to have come into operation on the 5th day of July 1982.

Short title and commence
ment.

2. The Schedule to the principal Ordinance is amended by Amendment of Schedule, 
deleting “£16.00”, “£12.00” and “£12.00” and substituting the fol
lowing respectively—

“£18.00”, “£13.50” and “£13.50”.

Passed by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland Islands 
this 28th day of July 1982.

R. Browning, 
Clerk to the Councils.

This printed impression has been carefully compared by me 
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. Browning,
Clerk to the Councils.



36

Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 13th day of August 1982.

R. M. HUNT, 
Civil Commissioner.

1982No. 4

Colony of the Falkland Islands

IN THE THIRTY-FIRST YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.
Rex Masterman Hunt, c.m.g. 

Civil Commissioner.

An Ordinance
To amend the Income Tax Ordinance.Title.

(1st January 1982)Date of commencement.

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland
Islands.

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Income Tax (Amend
ment) Ordinance 1982 and shall be deemed to have come into 
operation on the 1st January 1982 and shall apply to assessment for 
the year of assessment commencing on the 1st January 1982 and to 
subsequent years of assessment.

2. Section 14 of the principal Ordinance is amended in 
subsection (1) by deleting “£1,200” and substituting the following —

“£1,500”.

Short title and commence
ment.

Amendment of section 14. 
(Cap. 32)

3. Section 15 of the principal Ordinance is amendedAmendment of section 15.

in subsection (1) by deleting “£700” and substituting the 
following —

(a)

‘£900”;
in subsection (2) by deleting “£400” and substituting the 
following —

(b)

“£500”;

in paragraph (a) of subsection (3), by deleting “£700” and 
“£400” and substituting the following respectively —

“£900” and “£500”; and

(c)

in subsection (4), by deleting “£1,200” and substituting the 
following —

(d)

“£1,500”.



37

4. Section 16 of the principal Ordinance is amended Amendment of section 16.
(a) in subsection (1) by deleting “£400” and substituting the 

following —
“£500”; and

(b) in paragraph (i) of the proviso to subsection (1), by deleting 
“£440” and substituting the following —

“£550”.

5. Section 16a of the principal Ordinance is amended by 
deleting “£2,350” wherever it occurs and substituting the following —

“£2,950”.

Amendment of section 
16a.

Passed by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland Islands 
this 28th day of July 1982.

R. Browning, 
Clerk to the Councils.

This printed impression has been carefully compared by me 
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. Browning, 
Clerk to the Councils.



.

' •, **.■• v-4;



39

FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol XCI 28 SEPTEMBER 1982 No. 6

Appointments
Miss Jacqueline Jennings, Clerk, Public Service, 

25.11.81. On probation.
Miss Diane Berntsen, Clerk, Public Service, 

8.2.82. On probation.
Mrs. Janet Lynda Cheek, Teacher, Education 

Department, 21.7.82. On probation.

Dr. Bruce Marsden, m.b., ch.B., (Viet.) m.r.c.s., 
l.r.c.p., Senior Medical Officer, 13.9.82.

Harold Bennett, o.b.e., j.p., Registrar and Reg
istrar General, 16.12.81 - 13.1.82.

Harold Bennett, o.b.e., j.p., Registrar General, 
Registrar Supreme Court and Registrar Court of 
Appeal, 14.4.82 - 21.9.82.

Harold Bennett, o.b.e., j.p.. Senior Magistrate, 
14.4.82.

Ronald McCormick, Storeman, Central Store,
6.9.82.

Confirmation of Appointment 
Albert Charles Jones, Senior Filtration Plant 

Operator, Public Works Department, 3.9.81.

William Welsh. Senior Mechanic, Public Works 
Department, 15.9.82. On contract.

Miss Pauline Ann Lockey, Nursing Sister, 
Medical Department, 15.9.82. On contract.

Miss Eryl Ann Thomas, Registrar Supreme 
Court and Registrar General, 15.9.82. On contract.

Miss Natalie McPhee, Clerk, Public Service, 
16 9.82. On probation.

Promotion
Miss Anna Constance Eve King, Acting Cashier, 

Treasury Department, to Cashier, Treasury Depart
ment, 27.9.82. On probation.

Retirement
Douglas Roy Morrison, o.b.e., Deputy Chief 

Secretary and Establishments Officer, Secretariat, 
7.5.82.

Acting Appointments
Miss Anna Constance Eve King, Acting Cashier, 

Treasury Department, 24.7.82 - 26.9.82.
Jeremy Peter Baylis, Acting Headmaster, Edu

cation Department, 27.7.82.

Resignation
Adrian Bertrand Monk, o.b.e., j.p., Agricultural 

Officer, 31.8.82.



40

31st August 1982. 
His Excellency the Civil Commissioner has been 

pleased to appoint —

Other essential goods: profits ranged 
from 20% to 70%. Again the higher 
margins we find unacceptable.

5. Luxury goods: profit margins seem to be 
controlled by competition and demand.

Note. Figures made on the original return were not 
always in line with those of individual costings received 
on a later request.

4. We recommend —
(a) that some body or committee, including

a minimum of one Councillor and at 
least one person able to speak auth
oritatively for the consumer, should be 
set up with the power to examine the 
profit margins of items which the public 
consider to be excessively priced; and 
that that body or committee should 
have the right to publish the result of 
such examinations if they consider it in 
the public interest.

(b) that traders in a monopoly position who
are selling essential items should be 
urged to examine their profit margins 
where at present these are excessive.

5. Finally, we would like to thank the Sec
retariat staff, in particular our secretary, for their 
kind help and co-operation.

We have the honour to be,
Sir,

Your Excellency’s obedient servants 
L. G. Blake 
Mrs. M. Jennings 
W. H. Goss 
J. T. Clement

No. 26.

Mr. Brook Hardcastle, j.p., 
of Darwin, to be a Registrar under Section 4 of the 
Marriage Ordinance (Cap. 43), for the purpose of 
celebrating the marriage of David George Hewitt, 
divorcee, and Frances Agnes Browning, divorcee, 
both of Goose Green, at Goose Green.

Ref. LEG/19/2.

9th September 1982.No. 27.
The findings of the Cost of Living Committee 

for the quarter ended 31st March 1982 are pub
lished for general information —

Quarter ended Percentage increase 
over 1971 prices

303.99%31st March 1982

2. In accordance with the principle of the 
Wages Agreement for Stanley the average increase 
over the last four quarters is 292.48% and a further 
wage award of Id per hour is therefore payable 
with effect from 1st April 1982.

Ref. INT/2/2.

15th September 1982.
The findings of the Cost of Living Committee 

for the quarter ended 30th June 1982 are published 
for general information —

Quarter ended

30th June 1982

2. In accordance with the principle of the 
Wages Agreement for Stanley the average increase 
over the last four quarters is 297.92% and no in
crease in the hourly wage is therefore payable.

Ref. INT/2/2.

No. 28.

Chairman.
Member.
Member.
Member.

Ref. INT/2/4.

Percentage increase 
over 1971 prices

303.51%

Customs Ordinance (Cap. 16)
In exercise of the powers conferred by section 

4 of the Customs Ordinance I hereby appoint — 
Flight Sergeant John Wood, r.a.f.,

to be a temporary Customs Officer with effect from 
the 1st September 1982.

28th September 1982.

REPORT BY THE PRICES COMMISSION
The following report by the Prices Commission, 

which was considered and adopted by the Civil 
Commissioner in Council at a meeting of the 
Council held on 24th/25th August 1982, is pub
lished for general information —

Stanley,

No. 29.

L. J. Halliday, . 
Collector of Customs.

30th August 1982.

In the Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands
Notice under the Administration or Estates Ordinance 

(Cap. 1)
In the Matter of Lavinia Summers, deceased, of 

15 Brandon Road, Stanley, Falkland Islands, who 
died at Stanley on the 14th day of August 1982, 
intestate.

Whereas Keith Medlicott Summers, son of the 
deceased has applied for Letters of Administration 
to administer the estate of the said deceased in the 
Colony.

Notice is hereby given pursuant to section 4 
of the Administration of Estates Ordinance to all 
persons resident in the Colony who may have 
prior claim to such grant that the prayer of the 
Petitioner will be granted provided no caveat be 
entered in the Supreme Court within twenty-one 
days of the publication hereof.

11th March 1982.
Your Excellency,

We have the honour to submit our report under 
the terms of our appointment under the Commis
sions of Inquiry Ordinance.

2. We held four meetings and examined the 
returns provided by the Colony’s traders. We 
would like to express our gratitude for their co
operation. We used as a basis for the returns the 
list of goods at present in use in the Cost of Living 
index with some added items.

3. Our findings are —
1. The profit margin on foodstuffs, with a

maximum of 30%, is reasonable.
2. Clothing : profit margins fluctuated from

20% to close to 50%. Except for 
specialised fashion goods and items 
produced for tourist attractions, we 
find that the profit of 50% is excessive.

3. Footwear: fluctuation again from 25%
to 50%. For essential footwear a profit 
margin of 50 % is excessive.

H. Bennett, 
Registrar.

Stanley,
Falkland Islands.
6th September 1982.

S. C.&L. 20/82.



41

In the Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands
Notice under the Administration of Estates Ordinance 

(Cap. 1)
In the Matter of Doreen Millian Bonner, de

ceased, of Stanley, Falkland Islands, who died at 
Stanley on the 12th day of June 1982, intestate.

Whereas Henry John Bonner, widower of the 
deceased has applied for Letters of Administration 
to administer the estate of the said deceased in the 
Colony.

Notice is hereby given pursuant to section 4 
of the Administration of Estates Ordinance to all 
persons resident in the Colony who may have 
prior claim to such grant that the prayer of the 
Petitioner will be granted provided no caveat be 
entered in the Supreme Court within twenty-one 
days of the publication hereof.

persons resident in the Colony who may have 
prior claim to such grant that the prayer of the 
Petitioner will be granted provided no caveat be 
entered in the Supreme Court within twenty-one 
days of the publication hereof.

H. Bennett, 
Registrar.

Stanley,
Falkland Islands.
16th September 1982.

S.C.&L. 26/82.

In the Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands 
Notice under the Administration of Estates Ordinance 

(Cap. 1)
In the Matter of the Estate of Rupert Valentine 

Goodwin, deceased, of 48 Davis Street, Stanley, 
Falkland Islands.

Whereas June Elizabeth Goodwin, attorney for 
Kathleen Edith Marguerite Goodwin of 48 Davis 
Street aforesaid, has applied for Letters of Admin
istration with the Will annexed to administer the 
estate of the deceased.

Notice is hereby given pursuant to section 4 
of the Administration of Estates Ordinance to all 
persons resident in the Colony who may have 
prior claim to such grant that the prayer of the 
Petitioner will be granted provided no caveat be 
entered in the Supreme Court within twenty-one 
days of the publication hereof.

H. Bennett, 
Registrar.

Stanley,
Falkland Islands.
15th September 1982.

S.C.&L. 25/82.

In the Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands
Notice under the Administration of Estates Ordinance 

(Cap. 1)
In the Matter of Andrew Ludwig Clifford Smith, 

deceased of Chartres, Falkland Islands, who died at 
Stanley on the 7th day of September 1982, intestate.

Whereas Adeline Jane Smith, widow of the 
deceased has applied for Letters of Administration 
to administer the estate of the said deceased in the 
Colony.

E. A. Thomas, 
Registrar.

Stanley,
Falkland Islands.
24th September 1982.Notice is hereby given pursuant to section 4 

of the Administration of Estates Ordinance to all S.C.&L. 27/82.



■

f

f

'.

(

V

Printed at the Government Printing Office, Stanley, Falkland Islands. 
Price: Ten Pence.

'

1



!43

FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol XCI 29 OCTOBER 1982 No. 7

Appointments
Miss Lindsey Olga Coutts, Clerk, Public Service, 

1.10.82. On probation for two years.
Robert William Michael Down, Plumber, Public 

Works Department, 11.10.82. On contract.
Miss Linda Ann Rhys-Savin, Nursing Sister, 

Medical Department, 11.10.82. On contract.
Robert Mathers, Plumber, Public Works De

partment, 11.10.82. On contract.
Colin George Davies, Teacher, Education De

partment, 11.10.82. On contract.
Michael Rendell, Administrative Assistant, Sec

retariat, 11.10.82. On contract.
Michael Donaldson, Roads Supt., Public Works 

Department, 11.10.82. On contract.
Mrs. Phyllis Rendell, Teacher, Education De

partment, 11.10.82. On probation.
Miss Pamela Clasper, Teacher, Education De

partment, 11.10.82. On contract.
Stephen Leslie Burston, Storeman, Central 

Store, 18.10.82. On probation.
Promotion

Leslie Sidney Harris, from Senior Electrician, 
Public Works Department to Superintendent, Power 
Station, Public Works Department, 1.10.82.

Leonard Middleton, from Engineman, Power 
Station, Public Works Department to Electrical 
Mechanic, Public Works Department, 22.10.82.

Confirmation of Appointment
Phillip George Summers, e.d._. Deputy Chief 

Secretary and Establishments Officer, 17.4.81.

Acting Appointments
Derek S. Evans, Acting Headmaster, Infant/ 

Junior School, 26.6.82 - 18.8.82.
Mrs. Annie Elizabeth Peatfield, Acting Head

mistress, Infant/Junior School, 19.8.82 - 15.9.82.
Derek S. Evans, Acting Headmaster, Infant/ 

Junior School, 16.9.82.
Miss Shelley Livermore, Acting Clerk/Store- 

kceper, Medical Department, 1.10.82.

Completion of Contract
Peter Bernard Gilding, Headmaster, Stanley 

Senior School, Education Department, 30.7.82.

NOTICES
7th October 1982. 

Appointments - Police Reserve Officers 
The following have been appointed Police Re

serve Officers, Police and Prisons Department, with 
et't'ect from 7th October 1982 —

Anthony Cowling 
Michael Tracy 
John Terry Wood.

No.. 30.

Ref. POL/19/2.



44

8th October 1982.
Hydatid Eradication (Dogs) Order 1981 

(Under Section 12a of the Dogs Ordinance, Cap. 21) 
His Excellency the Civil Commissioner has 

appointed the following person to be an Inspector 
for the purpose of this Order —

Tony Anderson

No. 31. No. 36. 29lh October 1982. 
Appointments - Police Reserve Officers

The following have been appointed Police Re
serve Officers, Police and Prisons Department, with 
effect from 28th October 1982.

Sergeant Ian W. M. Simpson, r.a.f. 
Corporal David S. Jose 
Corporal Paul J. C. Milton 
Corporal Douglas M. Can- 
Corporal Paul D. Halkyard

Darwin Sections.
Ref. AGR/7/16.

R.A.F.
R.A.F.
R.A.F.
R.A.F.

No. 32. 18th October 1982.
Ref. POL/19/2.

The findings of the Cost of Living Committee 
for the quarter ended 30th September 1982 are 
published for general information — Customs Ordinance (Cap. 16)

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 
4 of the Customs Ordinance I hereby appoint — 

Sergeant Michael Tracy, r.a.f., 
to be a temporary Customs Officer with effect from 
the 1st September 1982.

Percentage increase 
over 1971 pricesQuarter ended 

30th September 1982
2. In accordance with the principle of the 

Wages Agreement for Stanley the average increase 
over the last four quarters is 303.74% and no in
crease in the hourly wage is therefore payable.

Ref. I NT/2/2.

308.86%

L. J. Halliday, 
Collector of Customs.

30th August 1982.

19th October 1982.No. 33.
Probate

In the Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands
Notice under the Administration of Estates Ordinance 

(Cap. 1)
In the Matter of Ivan William Fairley, deceased, 

of Goose Green, Falkland Islands, who died at 
Goose Green on the 20th day of August 1982, 
intestate.

Whereas Harold Bennett has applied for Letters 
of Administration to administer the estate of the 
said deceased in the Colony.

Notice is hereby given pursuant to Section 4 
of the Administration of Estates Ordinance to all 
persons resident in the Colony who may have 
prior claim to such grant that the prayer of the 
Petitioner will be granted provided no caveat be 
entered in the Supreme Court within twenty-one 
days of the publication hereof.

1Completion of Tours of Duty 
The following Police Officers completed their 

tours of duty on the 5th October 1982 —
Captain Alan Barley 
Staff Sergeant Ondre Shaw 
Staff Sergeant Michael Cooper 
Sergeant Steven May 
Sergeant Kevin Cox 
Sergeant John Burton 
Corporal Sean Farrell 
Corporal Anthony Savage 
Corporal Malcolm Davies 
Corporal Michael Hunt 
Corporal Gareth John 
Corporal Brian Wilkinson 
Corporal Richard Lawn 
Lance Corporal Gary Needham 
Lance Corporal Melvin Cooper 
Lance Corporal Stephen Dowling 
Lance Corporal Mark Myles

Eryl Thomas, 
Registrar.

Stanley,
Falkland Islands, 
25th October 1982.

Ref. POL/19/2.

20th October 1982. 
Hydatid Eradication (Dogs) Order 1981 

(Under Section 12a of the Dogs Ordinance, Cap. 21) 
His Excellency the Civil Commissioner has 

appointed the following person to be an Inspector 
for the purpose of this Order —

Brian Roy May

No. 34. S. C. &L. 21/82.

Notice under the Trustee Act 1925
(Section 27)

Re Hector Allan, deceased, late of Stanley, 
Falkland Islands, who died at Stanley, Falkland 
Islands, on the 19th day of August 1982, testate.

Notice is hereby given pursuant to section 27 
of the Trustee Act 1925 that creditors and other 
persons having claims against the estate of the 
above named deceased should give notice thereof in 
writing to Harold Bennett sole executor of the Will 
of the said Hector Allan not later than the 20th 
day of December 1982 after which time the exec
utor intends to distribute the estate of the said 
Hector Allan among the parties entitled thereto 
having regard only to the claims of which notice 
has been then received by the said executor.

Stanley,
18th October 1982.

San Carlos
Ref. AGR/7/16.

20th October 1982.No. 35.

Appointments - Police Reserve Officers 
The following have been appointed Police Re

serve Officers, Police and Prisons Department, with 
effect from 14th October 1982 —

Christopher Walker 
Ian James Biggs 
Michael Miller Cooke 
Francis Edwin Leonard Coveney 
Anthony Ernest Jenkins.

Ref. POL/19/2.



45

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1982 No. 824

SOUTH ATLANTIC TERRITORIES
The Falkland Islands and Dependencies 

(Interim Administration) Order 1982
18th June 1982 
18th June 1982 
18th June 1982

At the Court at Windsor Castle, the 18th day of June 1982
Present,

The Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty in Council

Her Majesty, by virtue and in exercise of the powers vested in Her by 
the British Settlements Acts 1887 and 1945 (a), and of all other powers 
enabling Her in that behalf, is pleased, by and with the advice of Her Privy 
Council, to order, and it is hereby ordered, as follows —
Citation and Commencement

1. (1) This Order may be cited as the Falkland Islands and 
Dependencies (Interim Administration) Order 1982.

(2) This Order shall come into operation on 18th June 1982.

Made .... 
Coming into Operation 
Laid before Parliament

Interpretation
2. In this Order —

“the Colony” and “the Dependencies” have the same meanings 
as in the Letters Patent;

“the Executive Council” means the Executive Council of the 
Colony as established by the Letters Patent;

“the Legislative Council” means the Legislative Council of the 
Colony as established by the Falkland Islands (Legislative 
Council) Orders in Council, 1948 to 1977 (b);

“the Letters Patent” means the Falkland Islands Letters 
Patent, 1948 to 1962 (c);

“the Royal Instructions” means the Instructions passed under 
the Royal Sign Manual and Signet to the Governor and 
Commander-in-Chief of the Colony and the Dependencies 
of 13th December 1948, as amended (d).

Civil Commissioner and Military Commissioner
3. For so long as this Order remains in force there shall be a 

Civil Commissioner and a Military Commissioner in and for the Colony 
and the Dependencies who shall be appointed and have such functions as 
hereinafter provided.
Establishment of Office of Civil Commissioner

4. (1) The Civil Commissioner shall be appointed by Her Majesty 
by Commission under Her Majesty’s Sign Manual and Signet, or by instruc
tions given through a Secretary of State, and shall hold office during Her 
Majesty’s pleasure.

(2) During any period when the office of Civil Commissioner is 
vacant or the holder thereof is for any reason unable to perform the 
functions of his office those functions shall, during Her Majesty's pleasure, 
be assumed and performed by such person as Her Majesty may designate 
in that behalf by instructions given through a Secretary of State.
Establishment of Office of Military Commissioner

5. The Military Commissioner shall be the Officer for the time 
being commanding Her Majesty’s Land Forces in the Colony and the

(o) 1887 c. 54 and 1945 c. 7 (9 & 10 Geo. 6).
(b) S.I. 1948/2573. 1950/1184, 1951/1946. 1955/ 1650. 1964/1397. 1972/668, 1973/598. 1975/1706,

1977/423.
(c) Rev. VII, p. 586; 1954 II, p. 2991; 1962 I. p. 1039.
{d) S.I. 1955 II. p. 3187; 1964 III. p. 5254; 1973 p. 2635; 1977 I. p. 2185.

I
■



46

Dependencies and shall, acting as appropriate through the Civil Commis
sioner, have responsibility for the defence and internal security (with the 
exception of the police) of the Colony and the Dependencies.
Powers and Duties of the Commissioners

6. The Civil Commissioner and the Military Commissioner shall 
each have such powers and duties as are conferred upon them by or under 
this Order or any other law, and such other powers and duties as Her 
Majesty may from time to time be pleased to assign to them, and, subject 
to the provisions of this Order and any other law, each Commissioner shall 
do or execute all things that belong to his office according to such instruc
tions, if any, as Her Majesty may, through a Secretary of State, from time 
to time see fit to give him.
Exercise of the Governor’s Functions

7. (1) For so long as this Order is in force —
(a) the office of Governor and Commander-in-Chief of the Colony

and Dependencies is suspended and the provisions of Article 
7 of the Letters Patent shall not have effect;

(b) the functions of that office shall vest in and be exercisable by
the Civil Commissioner in accordance with the provisions of 
this Order; and

(c) all references to the Governor or to the officer administering
the Government in any law (including the Royal Instructions) 
for the time being in force in the Colony or the Dependencies 
shall, unless the context otherwise requires, be construed as 
references to the Civil Commissioner.

(2) The Civil Commissioner shall consult with the Military 
Commissioner before exercising any function which appears to the Civil 
Commissioner to relate to defence or internal security (with the exception 
of the police) and shall act in accordance with the advice which the 
Military Commissioner then tenders to him; and he shall likewise act in 
accordance with the advice of the Military Commissioner on any matter 
on which the Military Commissioner considers it necessary in the interests 
of his responsibilities under this Order to give advice to the Civil Commis
sioner: Provided that the question whether the Civil Commissioner has 
on any matter consulted with the Military Commissioner or acted in 
accordance with his advice shall not be enquired into in any Court.

(3) Notwithstanding the provisions of Clause 10 of the Royal In
structions, the Civil Commissioner need not consult with the Executive 
Council on any matter on which he is required by subsection (2) of this 
section to consult with the Military Commissioner or on which the Military 
Commissioner has already, in accordance with the provisions of that sub
section, given advice to him.

Military Commissioner to attend Executive and Legislative Councils
8. The Military Commissioner shall have the right to attend and 

take part in the proceedings of the Executive Council and of the Legis
lative Council, but shall not have the right to vote in either Council.

Existing Law
9. (1) The provisions of this Order shall have effect notwith

standing the provision of any existing law and such law shall be applied 
with such adaptations, modifications and exceptions as are necessary to 
bring it into conformity with the provisions of this Order.

(2) For the purposes of this subsection, “existing law" means any 
law (including the Royal Instructions) in force in the Colony or the 
Dependencies immediately before the commencement of this Order.
Powers reserved to Her Majesty

10. (1) Her Majesty hereby reserves to Herself, Her Heirs and 
Successors, powers with the advice of Her or Their Privy Council, to 
revoke, add to or amend this Order as to Her or Them shall seem fit.

(2) Nothing in this Order shall affect the powers of Her Majesty 
in Council to make laws from time to time for the peace, order and good 
government of the Colony and the Dependencies.



47

BRITISH NATIONALITY ORDINANCE
(Chapter 6)

British Nationality Ordinance (Amendment of Schedule)
ORDER 1982

No. 1 of 1982. R. M. HUNT, 
Civil Commissioner.

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 4 of the British 
Nationality Ordinance, the Civil Commissioner in Council has made 
the following order —

1. This order may be cited as the British Nationality Ordin
ance (Amendment of Schedule) Order 1982.

2. The Schedule to the principal Ordinance is deleted and 
replaced by the following —

Citation.

Deletion and replacement 
of Schedule.

(Cap. 6)

“SCHEDULE 
Part I

(s. 3).

Table of Fees

Amount 
of feeMatter in which fee may be taken To whom fee is to be paid

£
1. Registration as a citizen under s. 5a (1) of the British Nationality 

Act 1948

Registration as a citizen under s. 5a (2) of the British Nationality 
Act 1948

Registration as a citizen under s. 6 (1) of the British Nationality 
Act 1948

Registration of a woman as a citizen under s. 6 (2) of the British 
Nationality Act 1948 ...

Registration of a minor as a citizen under s. 7 of the British 
Nationality Act 1948 ...

Grant of a certificate of naturalisation under s. 10 of the British 
Nationality Act 1948 ...

Registration as a citizen under s. 12 (6) of the British Nationality 
Act 1948

Registration of a declaration of intention to resume British 
nationality under s. 16 (2) of the British Nationality Act 1948

Grant of a certificate of citizenship in case of doubt under s. 25 
of the British Nationality Act 1948

Registration of a declaration of intention to resume citizenship 
under s. 4(2) of the Cyprus Act 1960

Registration as a citizen under s. 1 of the British Nationality 
Act 1964

Registration of a stateless person of full age as a citizen under 
s. 1 of the British Nationality (No. 2) Act 1964

Registration of a minor as a citizen under s. 1 of the British 
Nationality (No. 2) Act 1964

Registration of a woman as a British subject under s. 1 of the 
British Nationality Act 1965 ...

Supplying a certified true copy of a notice, certificate order, 
declaration or entry given, granted or made under the British 
Nationality Act 1948 ...

Witnessing the signing of an application or declaration or 
administering the oath of allegiance, in pursuance of paragraph 
4 of Schedule 1 of the British Nationality Regulations 1975 ...

Financial Secretary50.00
2.

The same150.00
3.

The same50.00
4.

The same50.00

5.
The same25.00

6.
The same150.00

7.
The same50.00

8.
The same50.00

9.
150.00 The same

10.
The same50.00

11.
50.00 The same

12.
50.00 The same

13.
25.00 The same

14.
50.00 The same

15.

10.00 The same

If the application or dec
laration is witnessed by a 
commissioner for oaths or 
notary public, to the com
missioner or notary public.

16.

2.00

O'



46

Part II

Payment of Fees

1. Where an application is made for the registration of a person as a citizen of the United Kingdom 
and Colonies under section 5a (2) of the British Nationality Act 1948 or for the grant of a certificate of 
naturalisation under section 10 of the British Nationality Act 1948 the fee of £150.00 payable in respect 
of the registration or certificate shall be paid in two stages. The initial sum of £75.00 shall be payable 
on application and the further sum of £75.00 shall be payable on registration or grant.

2. Where an application is made for the registration of a minor as a citizen of the United Kingdom
and Colonies under section 7 of the British Nationality Act 1948 or under section 1 of the British
Nationality (No. 2) Act 1964 at the same time as an application for the registration of another minor
having the same parent, the fee payable in respect of the applications shall be £25.00. In this paragraph
“parent” includes a step-parent and an adoptive parent.

Made by the Civil Commissioner in Council this 25th day of August 1982.

R. Browning, 

Clerk to the Councils.
Ref. LEG/10/19 II.

r.

4



49

BY THE QUEEN 

A PROCLAMATION
Determining the Specifications and Design for, and giving currency 
to, Silver and Cupro-Nickel Coins in Her Majesty’s Colony of the 
Falkland Islands

ELIZABETH R 

MARGARET

Whereas Her Majesty, in pursuance of the Regency Acts 1937 to 1953, 
was pleased, by Letter Patent dated the 30th day of September 1982, 
to delegate to the six Counsellors of State therein named or any two 
or more of them full power and authority during the period of Her 
Majesty’s absence from the United Kingdom to summon and hold on 
Her Majesty’s behalf Her Privy Council and to approve and sign on Her 
Majesty’s behalf any Proclamation relating to the affairs of any of Her 
Majesty’s Colonies and to do on Her Majesty’s behalf anything required 
to be done in relation to any such Proclamation:

Now, therefore, We, Elizabeth The Queen Mother and Margaret, 
Countess of Snowdon, being authorised thereto by the said Letters Patent 
and in exercise of the powers conferred by section 11 of the Coinage Act 
1870, section 2 (3) of the Decimal Currency Act 1967, and of all other 
powers enabling Her Majesty, and by and with the advice of Her Majesty’s 
Privy Council, do on Her Majesty’s behalf proclaim, direct and ordain as 
follows —

1. This Proclamation shall be published in the Official Gazette of the 
Falkland Islands and shall come into force there on the date of such 
publication.

2. (1) The following new coins, being coins of a standard weight of 
28*2759 grammes, a standard diameter of 38*608 millimetres and of a 
circular shape, shall be made —

(a) a silver coin of millesimal fineness 925; and
(b) a cupro-nickel coin of a standard composition of seventy-five per 

centum copper and twenty-five per centum nickel.
(2) In the making of the silver coin prescribed by section 2 (1) (a) of this 

Proclamation a remedy (that is, a variation from the standard weight, 
diameter or composition specified above) shall be allowed of an amount 
not exceeding the following, that is to say —

(a) a variation from the said standard weight of an amount per coin
(measured as the average of a sample of not more than one 
kilogramme of the coin) of 0*1296 grammes; and

(b) a variation from the said standard diameter of 0*125 millimetres
per coin; and

(c) a variation from the said standard composition of millesimal
fineness of 5.

(3) In the making of the cupro-nickel coin prescribed by section 2 (1) (b) 
of this Proclamation a remedy shall be allowed of an amount not exceeding 
the following, that is to say —

(a) a variation from the said standard weight of an amount per coin
(measured as the avarage of a sample of not more than one 
kilogramme of the coin) of 0*1296 grammes; and

(b) a variation from the said standard diameter of 0*125 millimetres
per coin; and

(c) a variation from the said standard composition of two per centum.

l

lit a 1■



5d

3. The design for the said coins shall be as follows —
(a) For the obverse impression the effigy of Her Majesty with the

inscription “QUEEN ELIZABETH II” to the left of the portrait 
with “FALKLAND ISLANDS” to the right and at the bottom 
“50 PENCE”.

(b) For the reverse impression a background of the Union Flag, to 
the left the Arms of the Falkland Islands with the inscription 
“LIBERATION” above and “14 JUNE 1982” below.

(c) Every silver and cupro-nickel coin shall have a graining upon
the edge.

4. The said coins shall be current within Her Majesty’s Colony of the 
Falkland Islands.

Given at the Court of Saint James, this 27th day of October in the year 
of our Lord One thousand nine hundred and eighty-two and in the thirty- 
first year of Her Majesty’s Reign.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN

Printed at the Government Printing Office, Stanley, Falkland Islands. 
Price: Twenty-eight Pence.



51

FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

25 NOVEMBER 1982Vol XC1 No. 8

Completion of ContractsAppointments
Michael Charles Lloyd Gaiger, ll.b., Attorney 

General, 27.10.82. On contract.
David Milligan, Building Supervisor, Public 

Works Department, 27.10.82. On contract.
David Robson, Assistant Director, Public Works 

Department, 27.10.82. On contract.
Major P. W. Peck, Staff Officer, Falkland Islands 

Defence Force, 1.11.82.
Miss Carolynne McIntyre, Clerk, Public Service, 

18.11.82. On probation.

Robert Rutterford, Teacher, Education Depart
ment, 12.5.82.

Stanley John Angel, Assistant Teacher, Edu
cation Department, 12.5.82.

Raymond Harvey Checkley, j.p., Registrar and 
Registrar General, 8.6.82.

Denis Place, Water Supervisor, Public Works 
Department, 17.7.82.

Mrs. Marjorie May McPhee, Clerk, Public 
Service, 31.10.82.

Retirement
Daniel Borland, Senior Forecaster, Meteorol

ogical Department, 8.8.82.
Resignations

Robert Short, Police Constable, Police and 
Prisons Department, 31.3.82.

Anthony John Bryson, Storeman, Central Store,
13.4.82.

Marjorie Bryson, Clerk, Public Service, 13.4.82. 
Patrick William Peck, Clerk, Public Service,

30.9.82.
Major P. G. Summers, e.d., Staff Officer, Falk

land Islands Defence Force, 31.10.82.

Acting Appointments
Derek Stanley Evans, Acting Headmaster, 

Infant/Junior School, 16.9.82 - 7.11.82.
John David Peatfield, Acting Superintendent of 

Education, 17.7.82 - 7.11.82.
Miss Haley Trina Bowles, Acting Cashier, 

Treasury Department, 2.11.82.

Confirmation of Appointments 
Mrs. Sandra Clifton, Clerk, Public Service,

1.7.80.
Darwin Lewis Clifton, Manager, Philatelic 

Bureau, Posts and Telecommunications Depart
ment, 1.9.81.

Derek Stanley Evans, Teacher, Education De
partment, 12.11.80.

Mrs. Eileen Vidal, R/T Operator, Posts and 
Telecommunications Department, 18.11.80.

NOTICES
No. 37. 5th November 1982.

Promotion
His Excellency the Civil Commissioner has 

been pleased to make the following promotion in 
the Falkland Islands Defence Force with effect 
from 1st November 1982 —Re-appointment

Mrs. Marjorie May McPhee, Clerk, Public 
Service, 1.11.82.

2nd Lieutenant P. W. Peck to the rank of Major.
Ref. SEC/19/1.I



52

In the Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands
Notice under the Administration of Estates Ordinance 

(Cap. 1)
In the matter of the estate of Frederick George 

Berntsen, deceased, of Port San Carlos, Falkland 
Islands who died at Stanley, Falkland Islands on 
the 23rd day of March 1982.

Whereas Kathleen Gladys Berntsen of Stanley. 
Falkland Islands has applied for Letters of Admin
istration with the Will annexed to administer the 
estate of the deceased.

Notice is hereby given pursuant to section 4 
of the Administration of Estates Ordinance to all 
persons resident in the Colony who may have 
prior claim to such grant that the prayer of the 
Petitioner will be granted provided no caveat be 
entered in the Supreme Court within twenty-one 
days of the publication hereof.

In the Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands 
Notice under the Administration of Estates Ordinance 

(Cap. 1)
In the matter of the estate of James Saron 

Jacobsen, deceased, of Stanley, Falkland Islands 
who died at Stanley on the 28th day of July 1980.

Whereas Charles Clifton of Stanley, attorney 
for Alastair Jacobsen, the son of the deceased, has 
applied for Letters of Administration to administer 
the estate of the said deceased in the Colony.

Notice is hereby given pursuant to section 4 
of the Administration of Estates Ordinance to all 
persons resident in the Colony who may have 
prior claim to such grant that the prayer of the 
Petitioner will be granted provided no caveat be 
entered in the Supreme Court within twenty-one 
days of the publication hereof.

Eryl Thomas, 
Registrar.Eryl Thomas. 

Registrar. 1 Stanley,
Falkland Islands.
12th November 1982.

Stanley,
Falkland Islands.
12th November 1982.

PROCLAMATION
No. 2 of 1982

In the name of Her Majesty ELIZABETH II, by the Grace of God of the United 
Kingdom of Great Britain and Northern Ireland and of Her other Realms and Territories 
Queen, Head of the Commonwealth, Defender of the Faith.

By His Excellency SIR REX MASTERMAN HUNT, Companion of the Most 
Distinguished Order of Saint Michael and Saint George, Civil Commissioner for the Colony 
of the Falkland Islands and its Dependencies.

WHEREAS it is provided by subsection (1) of section 24 of the Falkland Islands (Legis
lative Council) Orders 1948 to 1977 that the sittings of the Legislative Council shall be held 
at such times and places as the Civil Commissioner shall from time to time appoint by proc
lamation published in the Gazette:

NOW, THEREFORE, I, REX MASTERMAN HUNT, do hereby Proclaim that the 
next sitting of the Legislative Council of the Falkland Islands shall be held at 9.30 o’clock 
in the forenoon of Thursday, the 16th day of December 1982 at the Court and Council 
Chambers in the town of Stanley in the Falkland Islands.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the Colony of the Falkland Islands at 
Government House, Stanley, Falkland Islands this 25th day of November in the year of Our 
Lord One thousand Nine hundred and eighty-two.

R. M. HUNT, 
Civil Commissioner.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN

Ref. LEC/35/1.II.



53

HARBOUR ORDINANCE 
(Chapter 30)

Harbour (Berkeley Sound) Order 1982
No. 2 of 1982. R. M. HUNT, 

Civil Commissioner.

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 2 of the 
Harbour Ordinance, the Civil Commissioner in Council has made 
the following order —

1. This order may be cited as the Harbour (Berkeley Sound) 
Order 1982 and shall be deemed to have come into operation on the 
1st day of October 1982.

2. The water known as Berkeley Sound lying to the West of 
a line drawn from Menguera Point (also known as Mengeary Point) 
to Eagle Point is declared a harbour.

Made by the Civil Commissioner in Council this 26th day of 
October 1982.

Citation and commence
ment

Declaration of Harbour.

R. Browning, 
Clerk to the Councils.

Ref. CUS/10/3.

Application for a Publican‘s Retail Licence under the provisions 
of the Licensing Ordinance (Vol. I Cap 38)

In accordance with Section 7 (1) of the Licensing Ordinance, an application has been

Victory Bar
made by

Vivienne Esther Mary Perkins

for a Publican’s Retail Licence and provided no objection be taken to the granting of a licence 
before 15th December 1982 the same will be granted.

H. T. Rowlands, 
Financial Secretary.The Treasury, 

Stanley.
24th November 1982.





55

FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE
(Extraordinary)
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. XC1 14 DECEMBER 1982 No. 9

A Bill for
An Ordinance

To provide for the service of the year 1982-83.
BE IT ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Enacting clause. 

Falkland Islands, as follows—

Title.

1. This Ordinance may be cited for all purposes as the 
Appropriation (1982-83) Ordinance 1982.

Short title.

2. The Governor may cause to be issued out of the Public Appropriation of 
Revenue and other funds of the Colony and applied to the service of oJ,tht,17earf°i982'|3service 
the period 1st July 1982 to 30th June 1983, a sum not exceeding Four 
million, and fifty-four thousand, one hundred and seventy-nine pounds, 
which sum is granted and shall be appropriated for the purposes and 
to defray the charges of the several services expressed and particularly 
mentioned in the Schedule hereto which will come in course of 
payment during the year 1982-83



56

Schedule. SCHEDULE

£Number HEAD OF SERVICE

43,748
46,368

225,160
83,773

258,989
336,053

10,892
7,028

263,169
128,069
42,958

413,107
404,506
329,366
137,680
267,254

58,980
107,712
37,853
16,000
70,000

The Governor..................................................
Agriculture ................................................
Aviation ................................................
Customs and Harbour ...
Education ................................................
Medical ...
Meteorological .....................................
Military
Miscellaneous ...
Pensions and Gratuities .........................
Police and Prisons
Posts and Telecommunications .............
Public Works
Public Works Recurrent .........................
Public Works Special.....................................
Secretariat, Treasury and Central Store
Overseas Passages .....................................
Social Welfare ... .........................
Supreme Court and Legal .........................
Training ...
Falkland Islands Government Office, London

I.
II.

Ill
IV.
V.

VI.
VII.

VIII.
IX.
X.

XI.
XII.

XIII.
XIV.
XV.

XVI.
XVII.

XVIII.
XIX.
XX.

XXL

Total Ordinary Expenditure ... £ 3,288,665
Development A

Expenditure to be met from Colony funds ... 
Development B

Expenditure to be met from U.K. Aid

467,014

98,500

Total Ordinary and Development Expenditure 

Transfer to Development Fund
3,854,179

200,000XXII.

Total Expenditure ... £ 4,054,179

3. The Appropriation (Provisional) Ordinance 1982 is repealed.Repeal.
(1 of 1982.)

Ref. TRE/14/18.

Printed at the Government Printing Office, Stanley, Falkland Islands. 
Price: Seven Pence.



57

FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. XCI 23 DECEMBER 1982 No. 10

Appointments
Stephen Leslie Burston, Storeman, Central 

Store, 18.10.82. On probation.
Michael Sturdee Goodwin, Pilot, Aviation De

partment, 8.11.82. On probation.
John Coutts, Engineer, Aviation Department,

8.11.82. On probation.
Dr. Alison Ann Bleaney, Senior Medical Officer, 

Medical Department, 15.11.82. On contract.
Miss Lisa Molkenbuhr, Clerk, Public Service,

29.11.82. On probation.
Miss Daniela Clarke, Clerk, Public Service,

1.12.82. On probation.
Russell Blackman, Senior Engineer, mv Forrest, 

Customs and Harbour Department, 10.12.82. On 
probation.

No. 40. 16th December 1982.
It is hereby notified that the following dates 

have been set aside as Public Holidays in Stanley 
for 1983 —
New Year’s Day Monday, 3rd January (in lieu 

of Saturday, 1st January)
150th Anniversary Monday, 21st - Friday,

Celebrations 25th February
Good Friday
Her Majesty the Queen’s 

Birthday

Friday, 1st April

Thursday, 21st April
Tuesday, 14th June 
Monday, 3rd October

Liberation Day 
October Bank Holiday
Anniversary of the 
Battle of the Falkland

Islands Thursday, 8th December 
Monday, 26th December 
Tuesday, 27th December 
Wednesday, 28th December, 
(in lieu of Sunday. 25th

December).

Ref. INT/21/5.

Christmas Holidays ...

Acting Appointments
Harold Bennett, o.b.e., j.p., Senior Magistrate, 

14.4.82 - 31.10.82.
Jeremy Peter Baylis, Acting Headmaster, Edu

cation Department, 27.7.82 - 30.11.82.

Completion of Contract
Robert Muir Watson, Dental Surgeon, Medical 

Department, 5.10.82.
No. 41. 23rd December 1982.

Hydatid Eradication (Dogs) Order 1981 
(Under Section 12a of the Dogs Ordinance, Cap. 21) 
His Excellency the Civil Commissioner has 

appointed the following person to be an Inspector 
for the purpose of this Order —

Captain Alun Cooksley, r.a.v.c. 
for the whole Falkland Islands Area.

Re-appointments
Robert Muir Watson, Dental Surgeon, Medical 

Department, 1.11.82. On contract.
Denis Place, Water Supervisor, Public Works 

Department, 21.12.82. On contract.
Resignation

Richard Cain, Teacher, Education Department, 
15.12.82.

Ref AGR/7/16.

NOTICES No. 42. 23rd December 1982.
6th December 1982.No. 39. It is hereby notified for general information 

that in accordance with clause 3 (2) of the Royal 
Instructions of 1948, as amended, the Elected 
Members of the Legislative Council have elected 
the Honourable Anthony Thomas Blake, to be a 
Member of the Executive Council until 18th De
cember, 1983 vice the Honourable Lionel Geoffrey 
Blake, o.b.e., j.p.

Hydatid Eradication (Dogs) Order 1981
(Under Section 12a of the Dogs Ordinance, Cap. 21) 
His Excellency the Civil Commissioner has 

appointed the following person to be an Inspector 
for the purpose of this Order —

Melvyn J. Lloyd South Harbour
Ref. AGR/7/16. Ref. EXC/19/lc.



58

Customs Ordinance (Cap. 16);
In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 4 

of the Customs Ordinance I hereby appoint — 
Sergeant A. P. Rawle, r.a.f.,

to be a temporary Customs Officer with effect from 
25th November 1982.

In the Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands
Notice under tiie Administration of Estates Ordinance 

(Cap. 1)
In the matter of Euphemia Perry, deceased of 

Stanley, Falkland Islands, who died at Stanley, 
Falkland Islands on the 18th day of April 1982, 
intestate.

Whereas Marshall Barnes has applied for Let
ters of Administration to administer the estate of 
the said deceased in the Colony.

Notice is hereby given pursuant to section A 
of the Administration of Estates Ordinance to all 
persons resident in the Colony who may have 
prior claim to such grant that the prayer of the 
Petitioner will be granted provided no caveat be 
entered in the Supreme Court within twenty-one 
days of the publication hereof.

L. J. Halliday, 
Collector of Customs.

Customs Ordinance (Cap. 16)

In exercise of the powers conferred by Section A 
of the Customs Ordinance I hereby appoint — 

Flight Sergeant D. Asbridge, r.a.f.,
to be a temporary Customs Officer with effect from 
25th November 1982. Eryl Thomas, 

Registrar.Stanley,
Falkland Islands.
23rd December 1982. 
S.C. & L 30/82.

L. ]. Halliday. 
Collector of Customs.

No. 38. 2nd December 1982.

GRANT OF WRECK

It is notified for general information that the following Grant of Wreck has been made — 
Name of Vessel 
COQUIMBANA

To whom Granted
Mr. D. J. Eynon

Position
Tyssen Patch

Expiry Date
30th June 1984

2. Gazette Notice No. 8 of 3rd February 1982 is hereby rescinded.

Application for a Publican’s Retail Licence under the provisions 

of the Licensing Ordinance (Vol. I Cap 38)

In accordance with Section 7 (1) of the Licensing Ordinance, an application has been

Velma Malcolm

for a Publican’s Retail Licence and provided no objection be taken to the granting of a licence 
before 21st December 1982 the same will be granted.

made by
Rose Hotel

H. T. Rowlands, 
Financial Secretary.The Treasury, 

Stanley.
30th November 1982.

^ t


