ORDINANCES
of the COLONY of the
FALKLAND ISLANDS

and of the
DEPENDENCIES

enacted during the year

1982
together with
(1) Rules Regulations etc., etc.; and
(2) selected instruments originating in the United Kingdom

that were published in the Falkland Islands Gazette in 1982.

Important Note

The sequence of publications of Ordinances, Rules and Regulations that began in 1920 ceased
in 1981. As part of the work in producing the South Georgia and South Sandwich Islands laws
website it was decided to carry on the sequence informally until the end of 1985 — just beyond
the point when South Georgia and South Sandwich Islands became as separate Overseas

Territory.




PART I.

ORDINANCES.

Printed by and with the authority of the Attorney General, Stanley, Falkland Islands [2022].



TABLE OF CONTENTS

ORDINANCES OF THE COLONY OF THE FALKLAND ISLANDS

Ordinance No. 1 of 1982 Appropriation (Provisional) Ordinance 1982

“ “ 2 “ “ Old Age Pensions (Amendment) Ordinance 1982

“ “ 3 “ “ Non-contributory Old Age Pensions (Amendment) Ordinance 1982
“ “ 4 “ “ Income Tax (Amendment) Ordinance 1982

“ “ 5 “ “ Appropriation (1982-83) Ordinance 1982

“ “ 6 “ “ Old Age Pensions (Amendment) (No2) Ordinance 1982

ORDINANCES OF THE DEPENDENCIES

Ordinance No. 1 of 1982 Supplementary Appropriation (Dependencies) (1978-79) Ordinance
1981



32

Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 13th day of August 1982.

R. M. HUNT,
Civil Commissioner.

)

1982

Colony of the Falkland Islands

IN THE THIRTY-FIRST YEAR OF THE REIGN OF
Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.

REX MASTERMAN HUNT, C.M.G.
Civil Commissioner.

An Ordinance

Title, To provide for the Public Service of the
financial year ending the 30th day of June 1983.

Date of commencement. (Ist July 1982)

Preamble. WHEREAS due to the recent occupation of the Colony by
alien military forces the expenditure required for the service of the
Colony for the financial year ending on the 30th day of June 1983 has
been estimated provisionally at the sum of Three million, five hundred
thousand pounds:

NOW, THEREFORE, IT IS ENACTED by the Legislature of
the Colony of the Falkland Islands, as follows —

Short title. I. This Ordinance may be cited as the Appropriation (Pro-
visional) Ordinance 1982.

Appropriation of 2. A sum not exceeding One million, seven hundred and

ff[F0nREom the fourteen thousand pounds shall be and the same is hereby charged

general revenues and other .

funds. provisionally upon the revenue and other funds of the Colony for the

service of the financial year commencing on the lst day of July 1982,
and ending on the 30th day of June 1983, and the said sum so charged
may be expended in the manner expressed in the Schedule.



SCHEDULE Schedule.

Number HEAD OF SERVICE £
1. The Governor ... 21,000
IL Agriculture cige S on e 5 14,000
11 Aviation 142,000
Iv. Customs and Harbour ... 28,000
V. Education e - oo -+ 128,000
VI Medical ... 135,000
VIIL. Meteorological e . . e 9,000
VIIIL. Military 4,000
IX. Miscellaneous ... 20,000
X. Pensions and Gratuities 39,000
XI. Police and Prisons * 17,000
XII. Posts and Telecommunications 140,000
XII.  Public Works ... ... .. .. .. 152,000
XIV. Public Works Recurrent ¥ 122,000
XV. Public Works Special ... 26,000
XVI. Secretariat, Treasury and Central Store 92,000
XVII. Overseas Passages 57,000
XVIII. Social Welfare 38,000
XIX.  Supreme Court and Legal 15,000
XX.  Training ... 5,000
Total Ordinary Expenditure ... £ 1,204,000
Development A
Expenditure to be met from Colony funds ... 243,000
Development B
Expenditure to be met from U.K. Aid 267,000
ToTAL EXPENDITURE ... ... £1,714,000

Until the definitive Estimates for 1982/83 are prepared and approved
cxpenditure is to be maintained. as far as possible, at the same level as in
1981/82 Financial Year and applications for non-recurrent expenditure must
receive the prior approval of the Standing Finance Committee,

Ref. TRE/14/18.

Passed by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland Islands
this 28th day of July 1982.
R. BROWNING,
Clerk to the Councils.

This printed impression has been carefully compared by me
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. BROWNING,
Clerk to the Councils.



Title.

Date of commencement.

Short title and commence-

ment.

Amendment of Schedule.

Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 13th day of August 1982.

R. M. HUNT,
Civil Commissioner.

©

No. 2 1982

Colony of the Falkland Islands

IN THE THIRTY-FIRST YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth 1I.

REX MASTERMAN HUNT, C.M.G.
Civil Commissioner.

An Ordinance
To amend the Old Age Pensions Ordinance 1952.

(5th July 1982)

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland
Islands.

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Old Age Pensions
(Amendment) Ordinance 1982 and shall be deemed to have come into
operation on the 5th day of July 1982.

2. The Schedule to the principal Ordinance is amended by
deleting “£19.50”, “£13.00”, “£13.00” and “£13.00” and substituting
the following respectively —

“£22.00”, “£14.50”, “£14.50” and “£14.50".

Passed by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland Islands
this 28th day of July 1982.
R. BROWNING,

Clerk to the Councils.

This printed impression has been carefully compared by me
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. BROWNING,
Clerk to the Councils.



35

Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 13th day of August 1982.

R. M. HUNT,
Civil Commissioner.

No. 3 1982

Colony of the Falkland Islands

IN THE THIRTY-FIRST YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.

REX MASTERMAN HUNT, C.M.G.
Civil Commissioner.

An Ordinance

To amend the Non-contributory Old Age i
Pensions Ordinance 1961.

(5th July 1982)

Date of commencement.

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland
Islands.

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Non-contributory short title and commence-
Old Age Pensions {Amendment) Ordinance 1982 and shall be deemed ment.
to have come into operation on the 5th day of July 1982.

2. The Schedule to the principal Ordinance is amended by Amendment of Schedule.
deleting “£16.00”, “£12.00” and “£12.00” and substituting the fol-
lowing respectively— :

“£18.007, “£13.50"” and “£13.50".

Passed by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland Islands
this 28th day of July 1982.

R. BROWNING,
Clerk to the Councils.

This printed impression has been carefully compared by me
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. BROWNING,
Clerk to the Councils.



36

Assented to in Her Majesty's name this 13th day of August 1982.

R. M. HUNT,
Civil Commissioner.

No. 4 1982

Colony of the Falkland Islands

IN THE THIRTY-FIRST YEAR OF THL REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.

REX MASTERMAN HUNT, C.M.G.
Civil Commuissioner.

An Ordinance
Title. To amend the Income Tax Ordinance.

Date of commencement. (1st January 1982)

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland
Islands.

Short title and commence- 1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Income Tax (Amend-

s ment) Ordinance 1982 and shall be deemed to have come into
operation on the lst January 1982 and shall apply to assessment for
the year of assessment commencing on the Ist January 1982 and to
subsequent years of assessment.

Amendment of section 14. 2. Section 14 of the principal Ordinance is amended in

(Cap. 32) subsection (1) by deleting “£1,200” and substituting the following —
“£1,500".
Amendment of section 15. 3. Section 15 of the principal Ordinance is amended -
(a) in subsection (1) by deleting “£700" and substituting the
following —
“£900";
(b) in subsection (2) by deleting “£400" and substituting the
following —
“£500";

(c) in paragraph (a) of subsection (3), by deleting “£700" and
“£400” and substituting the following respectively —

“£900” and “£500”; and
(d) in subsection (4), by deleting “£1,200” and substituting the

following —
“£1,500”.



4. Section 16 of the principal Ordinance is amended —

(@) in subsection (1) by deleting ‘“£400" and substituting the
following —

“£500"; and

(b) in paragraph (i) of the proviso to subsection (1), by deleting
“£440" and substituting the following —
“£550".

5. Section 16a of the principal Ordinance is amended by
deleting “£2,350" wherever it occurs and substituting the following —

“£2,950”.

Passed by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland Islands
this 28th day of July 1982.

R. BROWNING,
Clerk to the Councils.

This printed impression has been carefully compared by me
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. BROWNING,
Clerk to the Councils.

Amendment of section 16.

Amendment of section
16a.

37












18

Title.

Preamble.

Short title

Appropriation of excess
expenditure for the period
1st July 1978 to 30th June
1979.

Assented to in Her Majesty's name this 18th day of March 1982.

R. M. HUNT,
Governor.

No. DS 1 1982

Falkland Islands Dependencies

IN THE THIRTY-FIRST YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.

REX MASTERMAN HUNT, C.M.G.
Governor.

An Ordinance

To legalise certain payments made in the year

1978-79 in excess of the expenditure sanctioned
by Ordinance No. DS 4 of 1979.

WHEREAS it is expedient to make [urther provision for the
service of the Falkland Islands Dependencies for the period first day
of July 1978 to the thirtieth day of June 1979.

ENACTED for the Dependencies of the Colony of the Falkland
Islands by the Governor of the Colony of the Falkland [slands and
the Dependencies thereof, as follows —

1. This Ordinance may be cited for all purposes as the
Supplementary Appropriation (Dependencies) (1978-79) Ordinance
1981.

2. The sums of money set forth in the Schedule hereto
having been expended for the services therein mentioned beyond the
amounts granted for those services by the Ordinance providing for
the service for the period first day of July 1978 to the thirtieth day
of June 1979, the same are hereby declared to have been duly laid
out and expended for the service of the Dependencies in that period,
and are hereby approved, allowed and granted in addition to the sum
mentioned for those services in the said Ordinance.



SCHEDULE

Head of Service Amount
South Georgia Expenditure
A. Personal Emoluments 4§
B. Other Charges 15,444
C. Special Expenditure 3,356
£18,848

Promulgated by the Governor on the 18th day of March 1982.

F. E. BAKER,

Chief Secretary.
Ref. SG/14/7.

Schedule.

19




PART II.

PROCLAMATIONS, REGULATIONS, ETc.




Proclamation

Regulation

TABLE OF CONTENTS

1982

“«

1982

“«

1982

“«

Regarding the sitting of the Legislative Council on 28 July 1982
Regarding the sitting of the Legislative Council on 16 December 1982
School (Amendment) Regulations 1982

Harbour (Amendment) Regulations 1982

British Nationality Ordinance (Amendment of Schedule) Order 1982

Harbour (Berkeley Sound) Order 1982



22

PROCLAMATION

No. 1 of 1982

IN THE NAME of Her Majesty ELIZABETH II, by the Grace of God ol the United
Kingdom of Great Britain and Northern Ireland and of Her other Realms and Territories
Queen, Head of the Commonwealth, Defender of the Faith.

By His ExceLLency REX MASTERMAN HUNT, EsqQuirg, Companion of the Most
Distinguished Order of Saint Michael and Saint George, Civil Commissioner for the Colony
of the Falkland Islands and its Dependencies.

WHEREAS it is provided by subsection (1) of section 24 of the Falkland Islands (Lcgis-
lative Council) Orders 1948 to 1977 that the sittings of the Legislative Council shall be held
at such times and places as the Civil Commissioner shall from time to time appoint by proc-
lamation published in the Gazette:

NOW, THEREFORE, I, REX MASTERMAN HUNT, do hereby ProctAIM that the
next sitting of the Legislative Council of the Falkland Islands shall be held at 9.30 o'clock
in the forenoon of Wednesday, the 28th day of july 1982 at the Court and Council Chambers
in the town of Stanley in the Falkland Islands.

GIVEN under my hand and the Public Seal of the Colony of the Falkland Islands at
Government House, Stanley, Falkland Islands this 6th day of July in the year of Qur Lord
One thousand Nine hundred and eighty-two.

R. M. HUNT,

Civil Commissioner.

GOD SAVE THE QUELEN

Ref. LEC/35/1.II.




52

In the Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands | In the Supreme Court of the Falkland Islands
NOTICE UNDER THE ADMINISTRATION OF ESTATES ORDINANCE NOTICE UNDER THE ADMINISTRATION OF ESTATES ORDINANCE
(Cap. 1) (Cap. 1)

IN THE MATIER of the estate of James Saron
Jacobsen, deceased, of Stanley, Falkland Islands
who died at Stanley on the 28th day of July 1980.

WHEREAS Charles Clifton of Stanley, attorney

IN THE MATTER of the estate of Frederick George
Berntsen, deceased, of Port San Carlos, Falkland
Islands who died at Stanley, Falkland Islands on
the 23rd day of March 1982,

WHEREAS Kathleen Gladys Berntsen of Stanley. for Alastair Jacobsen, the son of the deceased, has
Falkland Islands has applied for Letters of Admin- applied for Letters of Administration to administer
istration with the Will annexcd to administer the | the estate of the said deceased in the Colony.
estate of the deceased. NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN pursuant to section 4

NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVEN pursuant to section 4 of the Administration of Estates Ordinance to all
of the Administration of Estates Ordinance to all | persons resident in the Colony who may have
persons resident in the Colony who may have prior claim to such grant that the prayer of the
prior claim to such grant that the prayer of the Petitioner will be granted provided no caveat be
Petitioner will be granted provided no caveat be entered in the Suvreme Court within twenty-one
entered in the Supreme Court within twenty-one days of the publication hereof.
days of the publication hereof.

Z P EryL THOMAS,
ErYL THOMAS. Registrar.
Registrar. Stanliey,
Stanley, Falkland Islands.
Falkland Islands. 12th November 1982

12th November 1982,

PROCLAMATION

No. 2 of 1982

IN THE NAME of Her Majesty ELIZABETH 1I, by the Grace of God of the United
Kingdom of Great Britain and Northern Ireland and of IHer other Realms and Territories
Queen, Head of the Commonwealth, Defender of the Faith.

By His ExceLLENcy SIR REX MASTERMAN HUNT, Companion of the Most
Distinguished Order of Saint Michael and Saint George, Civil Commissioner for the Colony
of the Falkland Islands and its Dependencies.

WHEREAS it is provided by subsection (1) of section 24 of the Falkland Islands (Legis-
lative Council) Orders 1948 to 1977 that the sittings of the Legislative Council shall be held
at such times and places as the Civil Commissioner shall from time to time appoint by proc-
lamation published in the Gazette:

NOW, THEREFORE, I, REX MASTERMAN HUNT, do hereby ProcLAIM that the
next sitting of the Legislative Council of the Falkland Islands shall be held at 9.30 o’clock
in the forenoon of Thursday, the 16th day of December 1982 at the Court and Council
Chambers in the town of Stanley in the Falkland Islands.

GIVEN under my hand and the Public Seal of the Colony of the Falkland Islands at
Government House, Stanley, Falkland Islands this 25th day of November in the year of Our
Lord One thousand Nine hundred and eighty-two.

R. M. HUNT,
Civil Commissioner.
GOD SAVE THE QUEEN

Ref. LEC/35/1. 1L



EDUCATION ORDINANCE 1967

School (Amendment) Regulations 1982

No. 1 of 1982.

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 16 of the
Education Ordinance 1967, the Governor in Council has made the
following regulations —

1. These regulations may be cited as the School (Amendment)
Regulations 1982 and shall be deemed to have come into operation on

the 1st day of

January 1982.

2. Regulation 4 of the principal regulations is revoked and
replaced by the following —

“School terms
and holidays.

Made by the

Ref. EDU/10/L.

4. (1) For recognised Stanley schools, the school
year shall be of three terms, the first of fourteen weeks,
the second of twelve weeks and the third of thirteen
weeks duration, so arranged to allow a holiday of three
weeks in June, three weeks in September and seven
weeks, commencing with and including, the Thursday
of the week preceding the week in which Christmas
day occurs; such dates to be notified by publication in
the Gazette.

(2) A mid-term holiday not exceeding one day in
duration may be granted in each term to children in the
reception classes of the Infant School at the discretion
of the Headmaster.

(3) Recognised schools in Camp shall take the
same holidays as Stanley schools, though the Super-
intendent may authorise changes in these dates to
coincide with farm holidays if so petitioned by farm
managers, provided that such alternative arrangements
do not reduce the total number of days worked in the
year.”.

Governor in Council this 3rd day of February 1982.

R. BROWNING,
Clerk of Councils.

R. M. HUNT,

Governor.

Citation and commence-
ment.

Replacement of regulation
4



20

HARBOUR ORDINANCE
(Chapter 30)

Harbour (Amendment) Regulations 1982

No. 2 of 1982.

Citation and commence-
ment.

Amendment of Schedule
I,
(Cap. 30 sub. leg.)

R. M. HUNT,
Governor.

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 3 of the
Harbour Ordinance, the Governor in Council has made the following
regulations —

1. These regulations may be cited as the Harbour (Amend-
ment) Regulations 1982 and shall be deemed to have come into
operation on the lst day of July 1981.

2. Schedule III to the principal regulations is amended by
deleting paragraph (1) of Item 1 and substituting the following —
“(1) The following harbour dues shall be payable on all vessels
arriving in the Colony —

£
Yachts ... i ; : Free
Vessels under 15 tons ... - Free
Vessels of over 15 tons and up to 50 tons 96
Vessels of over 50 tons and up Lo 500 tons . 120
Vessels of over 500 tons and up to 800 tons 132
Vessels of over 800 tons and up to 1,000 tons 168
Vessels of over 1,000 tons and up to 1.500 tons 192
Vessels of over 1,500 tons and up to 2,000 tons - 240
Vessels of over 2,000 tons and up to 5,000 tons 288
Vessels of over 5,000 tons and up to 7,000 tons 360
Vessels of over 7,000 tons and up to 10,000 tons 540
Vessels of over 10.000 tons and up to 15,000 tons 660
Vessels of over 15,000 tons and up to 20,000 tons 780
Vessels of over 20,000 tons ... = 900
Locally registered vessels normally employed in trading ... Frec!”,

Made by the Governor in Council this 3rd day of March 1982.

R. BROWNING,
Clerk of Councils.

Ref. CUS/10/3.




e e—

47

BRITISH NATIONALITY ORDINANCE
(Chapter 6)

British Nationality Ordinance (Amendment of Schedule)
ORDER 1982

No. 1 of 1982. R. M. HUNT,
Civil Commissioner.

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 4 of the British
Nationality Ordinance, the Civil Commissioner in Council has made
the following order —

1. This order may be cited as the British Nationality Ordin- Citation.
ance (Amendment of Schedule) Order 1982.

2. The Schedule to the principal Ordinance is deleted and Deletion and replacement
replaced by the following — of Schedule.
(Cap. 6)

“SCHEDULE s 3).
ParT I

TaBLe or FEES

Amount

Matter in which fee may be taken Silfea To whom fee is to be paid
£
1. Registration as a citizen under s. 54 (1) of the British Nationality
Act 1948 .. ... 50.00 Financial Secretary
2. Registration as a citizen under s. 5A (2) of the British Nationality
Act 1948 ... 150.00 The same
3. Registration as a citizen under s. 6 (1) of the British Nationality
Act 1948 50.00 The same
4. Registration of a woman as a citizen under s. 6 (2) of the British
Nationality Act 1948 ... 50.00 The same
5. Registration of a minor as a citizen under s. 7 of the British
Nationality Act 1948 ... 25.00 The same
6. Grant of a certificate of naturalisation under s. 10 of the British
Nationality Act 1948 ... ... 150,00 The same
7. Registration as a citizen under s. 12 (6) of the British Nationality
Act 1948 50.00 The same

8. Registration of a declaration of intention to resume British
nationality under s. 16 (2) of the British Nationality Act 1948 50.00 The same

9. Grant of a certificate of citizenship in case of doubt under s. 25

of the British Nationality Act 1948 ... 150.00 The same
10. Registration of a declaration of intention to resume citizenship

under s. 4 (2) of the Cyprus Act 1960 50.00 The same
11. Registration as a citizen under s. 1 of the British Nationaiity

Act 1964 ... 50.00 The same
12. Registration of a stateless person of full age as a citizen under

s. 1 of the British Nationality (No. 2) Act 1964 ... 50.00 The same
13. Registration of a minor as a citizen under s. 1 of the British

Nationality (No. 2) Act 1964 ... 25.00 The same
14. Registration of a woman as a British subject under s. 1 of the

British Nationality Act 1965 ... 50.00 The same

15. Supplying a certified true copy of a notice, certificate order,
declaration or entry given, granted or made under the British

Nationality Act 1948 ... 10.00 The same

16. Witnessing the signing of an application or declaration or If the application or dec-
administering the oath of allegiance, in pursuance of paragraph laration is witnessed by a
4 of Schedule 1 of the British Nationality Regulations 1975 ... 2.00 commissioner for oaths or

notary public, to the com-
missioner or notary public.




48

ParT II

PaymenT oF FEES

1. Where an application is made for the registration of a person as a citizen of the United Kingdom
and Colonies under section 5a (2) of the British Nationality Act 1948 or for the grant of a certificate of
naturalisation under section 10 of the British Nationality Act 1948 the fee of £150.00 payable in respect
of the registration or certificate shall be paid in two stages. The initial sum of £75.00 shall be payable
on application and the further sum of £75.00 shall be payable on registration or grant.

2. Where an application is made for the registration of a minor as a citizen of the United Kingdom
and Colonies under section 7 of the British Nationality Act 1948 or under section 1 of the British
Nationality (No. 2) Act 1964 at the same time as an application for the registration of another minor
having the same parent, the fee payable in respect of the applications shall be £25.00. In this paragraph
*‘parent” includes a step-parent and an adoptive parent.

Made by the Civil Commissioner in Council this 25th day of August 1982.

R. BROWNING,

Clerk to the Councils.
Ref. LEG/10/191I.

N



53

HARBOUR ORDINANCE
(Chapter 30)

Harbour (Berkeley Sound) Order 1982

No. 2 of 1982. R. M. HUNT,
Civil Commissioner.

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 2 of the
Harbour Ordinance, the Civil Commissioner in Council has made
the following order —

1. This order may be cited as the Harbour (Berkeley Sound) Citation and commence-
Order 1982 and shall be deemed to have come into operation on the ™
Ist day of October 1982.

2. The water known as Berkeley Sound lying to the West of Declaration of Harbour.
a line drawn from Menguera Point (also known as Mengeary Point)
to Eagle Point is declared a harbour.

Made by the Civil Commissioner in Council this 26th day of
October 1982.
R. BROWNING,

Clerk to the Councils.
Ref. CUS/10/3.

Application for a Publican's Retail Licence under the provisions
of the Licensing Ordinance (Vol. | Cap 38)

In accordance with Section 7 (1) of the Licensing Ordinance, an application has been

made by
VIVIENNE ESTHER MARY PERKINS — VICTORY BAR

for a Publican’s Retail Licence and provided no objection be taken to the granting of a licence
before 15th December 1982 the same will be granted.

H. T. ROWLANDS,
The Treasury, Financial Secretary.
Stanley.
24th November 1982.



PART IlI.

UNITED KINGDOM INSTRUMENTS PUBLISHED IN THE
FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE IN 1982




TABLE OF CONTENTS

Proclamation 27 October 1982 HM Queen’s Proclamation regarding Coinage

The Falkland Islands and Dependencies (Interim Administration)
Order 1982

Order in 824 of 1982
Council



BY THE QUEEN
A PROCLAMATION

DETERMINING THE SPECIFICATIONS AND DESIGN FOR, AND GIVING CURRENCY
TO, SILVER AND CuUPRO-NICKEL CoINS IN HER MaAJESTY’S COLONY OF THE
FALKLAND ISLANDS

ELIZABETH R
MARGARET

Whereas Her Majesty, in pursuance of the Regency Acts 1937 to 1953,
was pleased, by Letter Patent dated the 30th day of September 1982,
to delegate to the six Counsellors of State therein named or any two
or more of them full power and authority during the period of Her
Majesty's absence from the United Kingdom to summon and hold on
Her Majesty’s behalf Her Privy Council and to approve and sign on Her
Majesty's behalf any Proclamation relating to the affairs of any of Her
Majesty’s Colonies and to do on Her Majesty’s behalf anything required
to be done in relation to any such Proclamation:

Now, therefore, We, Elizabeth The Queen Mother and Margaret,
Countess of Snowdon, being authorised thereto by the said Letters Patent
and in exercise of the powers conferred by section 11 of the Coinage Act
1870, section 2 (3) of the Decimal Currency Act 1967, and of all other
powers enabling Her Majesty, and by and with the advice of Her Majesty’s
Privy Council, do on Her Majesty’s behalf proclaim, direct and ordain as
follows —

1. This Proclamation shall be published in the Official Gazette of the
Falkland Islands and shall come into force there on the date of such
publication.

2. (1) The following new coins, being coins of a standard weight of
28:2759 grammes, a standard diameter of 38-608 millimetres and of a
circular shape, shall be made —

(@) a silver coin of millesimal fineness 925; and

(b) a cupro-nickel coin of a standard composition of seventy-five per
centum copper and twenty-five per centum nickel.

(2) In the making of the silver coin prescribed by section 2 (1) (a) of this
Proclamation a remedy (that is, a variation from the standard weight,
diameter or composition specified above) shall be allowed of an amount
not exceeding the following, that is to say —

(@) a variation from the said standard weight of an amount per coin

(measured as the average of a sample of not more than one
kilogramme of the coin) of 0-1296 grammes; and

(b) a variation from the said standard diameter of 0-125 millimetres
per coin; and

(¢) a variation from the said standard composition of millesimal
fineness of 5.

(3) In the making of the cupro-nickel coin prescribed by section 2 (1) (b)
of this Proclamation a remedy shall be allowed of an amount not exceeding
the following, that is to say —

(@) a variation from the said standard weight of an amount per coin
(measured as the avarage of a sample of not more than one
kilogramme of the coin) of 0-1296 grammes; and

(b) a variation from the said standard diameter of 0-125 millimetres
per coin; and

(c) a variation from the said standard composition of two per centum.

49



50

3. The design for the said coins shall be as follows —

(a) For the obverse impression the effigy of Her Majesty with the
inscription “QUEEN ELIZABETH II” to the left of the portrait
with “FALKLAND ISLANDS” to the right and at the bottom
“50 PENCE".

(b) For the reverse impression a background of the Union Flag, to
the left the Arms of the Falkland Islands with the inscription
“LIBERATION” above and “14 JUNE 1982"” below.

(c) Every silver and cupro-nickel coin shall have a graining upon
the edge.

4. The said coins shall be current within Her Majesty's Colony of the
Falkland Islands.

Given at the Court of Saint James, this 27th day of October in the year
of our Lord One thousand nine hundred and eighty-two and in the thirty-
first year of Her Majesty’s Reign.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN

Printed at the Government Printing Office, Stanley, Falkland Islands.
Paice: Twenty-cight Pence.




STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1982 No. 824
SOUTH ATLANTIC TERRITORIES

The Falkland Islands and Dependencies
(Interim Administration) Order 1982

Made - - - - 18th June 1982
Coming into Operation 18th June 1982
Laid before Parliament 18th June 1982

At the Court at Windsor Castle, the 18th day of June 1982
Present,
THE QUEEN’S MOST EXCELLENT MAJESTY IN COUNCIL

Her Majesty, by virtue and in exercise of the powers vested in Her by
the British Settlements Acts 1887 and 1945 (a), and of all other powers
enabling Her in that behalf, is pleased, by and with the advice of Her Privy
Council, to order, and it is hereby ordered, as follows —

Citation and Commencement

1. (1) This Order may be cited as the Falkland Islands and
Dependencies (Interim Administration) Order 1982.

(2) This Order shall come into operation on 18th June 1982,

Interpretation
2. In this Order —

“the Colony” and “the Dependencies” have the same meanings
as in the Letters Patent;

“the Executive Council” means the Executive Council of the
Colony as established by the Letters Patent;

“the Legislative Council” means the Legislative Council of the
Colony as established by the Falkland Islands (Legislative
Council) Orders in Council, 1948 to 1977 (b);

“the Letters Patent” means the Falkland Islands Letters
Patent, 1948 to 1962 (c);

“the Royal Instructions” means the Instructions passed under
the Royal Sign Manual and Signet to the Governor and
Commander-in-Chief of the Colony and the Dependencies
of 13th December 1948, as amended (d).

Civil Commissioner and Military Commissioner

3. For so long as this Order remains in force there shall be a
Civil Commissioner and a Military Commissioner in and for the Colony
and the Dependencies who shall be appointed and have such functions as
hereinafter provided.

Establishiment of Office of Civil Commissioner

4. (1) The Civil Commissioner shall be appointed by Her Majesty
by Commission under Her Majesty’s Sign Manual and Signet, or by instruc-
tions given through a Secretary of State, and shall hold office during Her
Majesty’s pleasure.

(2) During any period when the office of Civil Commissioner is
vacant or the holder thereof is for any reason unable to perform the
functions of his office those functions shall, during Her Majesty’s pleasure,
be assumed and performed by such person as Her Majesty may designate
in that behalf by instructions given through a Secretary of State.

Establishment of Office of Military Commissioner

5. The Military Commissioner shall be the Officer for the time
being commanding Her Majesty’s Land Forces in the Colony and the

(a) 1887 c. 54 and 1945 ¢c. 7 (9 & 10 Geo. 6).

(b) S.I. 1948/2573, 1950/1184, 1951/1946. 1955/1650. 1964/1397. 1972/668, 1973/598. 1975/1706,
1977/423.

(©) Rev. VII, p. 586: 1954 II, p. 2991; 1962 1, p. 1039.
(d) S.I 1955 II, p. 3187; 1964 1IL p. 5254 1973 p. 2635: 1977 L, p. 2185,

45




46

Dependencies and shall, acting as appropriate through the Civil Commis-
sioner, have responsibility for the defence and internal security (with the
exception of the police) of the Colony and the Dependencies.

Powers and Duties of the Commissioners

6. The Civil Commissioner and the Military Commissioner shall
each have such powers and duties as are conferred upon them by or under
this Order or any other law, and such other powers and duties as Her
Majesty may from time to time be pleased to assign to them, and, subject
to the provisions of this Order and any other law, each Commissioner shall
do or execute all things that belong to his office according to such instruc-
tions, if any, as Her Majesty may, through a Secretary of State, from time
to time see fit to give him.

Exercise of the Governor's Functions

7. (1) For so long as this Order is in force —

(a) the office of Governor and Commander-in-Chief of the Colony
and Dependencies is suspended and the provisions of Article
7 of the Letters Patent shall not have effect;

(b) the functions of that office shall vest in and be exercisable by
the Civil Commissioner in accordance with the provisions of
this Order; and

(c) all references to the Governor or to the officer administering
the Government in any law (including the Royal Instructions)
for the time being in force in the Colony or the Dependencies
shall, unless the context otherwise requires, be construed as
references to the Civil Commissioner.

(2) The Civil Commissioner shall consult with the Military
Commissioner before exercising any function which appears to the Civil
Commissioner to relate to defence or internal security (with the exception
of the police) and shall act in accordance with the advice which the
Military Commissioner then tenders to him; and he shall likewise act in
accordance with the advice of the Military Commissioner on any matter
on which the Military Commissioner considers it necessary in the interests
of his responsibilities under this Order to give advice to the Civil Commis-
sioner: Provided that the question whether the Civil Commissioner has
on any matter consulted with the Military Commissioner or acted in
accordance with his advice shall not be enquired into in any Court.

(3) Notwithstanding the provisions of Clause 10 of the Royal In-
structions, the Civil Commissioner need not consult with the Executive
Council on any matter on which he is required by subsection (2) of this
section to consult with the Military Commissioner or on which the Military
Commissioner has already, in accordance with the provisions of that sub-
section, given advice to him.

Military Commissioner to attend Executive and Legislative Councils

8. The Military Commissioner shall have the right to attend and
take part in the proceedings of the Executive Council and of the Legis-
Jative Council, but shall not have the right to vote in either Council.

Existing Law

9. (1) The provisions of this Order shall have effect notwith-
standing the provision of any existing law and such law shall be applied
with such adaptations, modifications and exceptions as are necessary to
bring it into conformity with the provisions of this Order.

(2) For the purposes of this subsection, “existing law” means any

law (including the Royal Instructions) in force in the Colony or the
Dependencies immediately before the commencement of this Order.

Powers reserved to Her Majesty

10. (1) Her Majesty hereby reserves to Herself, Her Heirs and
Successors, powers with the advice of Her or Their Privy Council, to
revoke, add to or amend this Order as to Her or Them shall seem fit.

(2) Nothing in this Order shall affect the powers of Her Majesty
in Council to make laws from time to time for the peace, order and good
government of the Colony and the Dependencies.



ORDINANCES
of the COLONY of the
FALKLAND ISLANDS

and of the

DEPENDENCIES

enacted during the year

1983
together with
(1) Rules Regulations etc., etc.; and
(2) selected instruments originating in the United Kingdom

that were published in the Falkland Islands Gazette in 1983.

Important Note

The sequence of publications of Ordinances, Rules and Regulations that began in 1920 ceased
in 1981. As part of the work in producing the South Georgia and South Sandwich Islands laws
website it was decided to carry on the sequence informally until the end of 1985 — just beyond
the point when South Georgia and South Sandwich Islands became as separate Overseas

Territory.




PART I.

ORDINANCES.

Printed by and with the authority of the Attorney General, Stanley, Falkland Islands [2022].



TABLE OF CONTENTS

ORDINANCES OF THE COLONY OF THE FALKLAND ISLANDS

Ordinance No. 1 of 1983 Falkland Islands Development Corporation Ordinance 1983

“ “ 2 “ “ Taxes and Duties (Special Exemptions) Ordinance 1983

“ “ 3 “ “ Appropriation (1983-84) Ordinance 1983

“ “ 4 “ “ Old Age Pensions (Amendment) Ordinance 1983

“ “ 5 “ “ Non-Contributory Old Age Pensions (Amendment) Ordinance 1983
“ “ 7t “ Savings Bank (Dissolution) Ordinance 1983

“ “ g8 “ “ Application of Enactments (Amendment) Ordinance 1983
“ “ 9 “ “ Education (Amendment) Ordinance 1983

“ “ 0 “ “ Banking (Amendment) Ordinance 1983

“ “ 11 “ “ Licensing (Amendment) Ordinance 1983

“ “ 12 “ “ Road Traffic (Amendment) Ordinance 1983

“ “ 13 “ “ Income Tax (Amendment) Ordinance 1983

! There was no Ordinance No6








































































PART II.

PROCLAMATIONS, REGULATIONS, ETc.




Proclamation

Regulation

TABLE OF CONTENTS

1983

“«

“«

“«

“«

1983

“«

1983

“«

“«

“«

1983

“«

Regarding the sitting of the Legislative Council on 25 March 1983
Regarding the sitting of the Legislative Council on 21 June 1983
Regarding the sitting of the Legislative Council on 15 August 1983
Regarding the sitting of the Legislative Council on 14 November 1983

Commencement of Falkland Islands (Interim Administration)
(Amendment) Order in Council 1983

Road Traffic (Protective Headgear) Regulations 1983

Trout and Salmon Fishing (Amendment) Regulations 1983
Legislative Council (Elections) (Variation of Dates) Order 1983
Protection of Wrecks (Ardent and Antelope Designation) Order 1983
Post Office (Amendment) Order 1985

Fugitive Offenders (Designated Commonwealth Countries)
(Amendment) Order 1983

Income Tax (Annual Values) Rules 1983

Currency Notes (Amendment) Rules 1983
















































PART IlI.

UNITED KINGDOM INSTRUMENTS PUBLISHED IN THE
FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE IN 1983




TABLE OF CONTENTS

Proclamation 24 November 1982 HM Queen’s Proclamation regarding Coinage

Proclamation 24 November 1982 HM Queen’s Proclamation regarding Coinage












ORDINANCES
of the COLONY of the
FALKLAND ISLANDS

and of the

DEPENDENCIES

enacted during the year

1984
together with

Rules Regulations etc., etc..

Important Note

The sequence of publications of Ordinances, Rules and Regulations that began in 1920 ceased
in 1981. As part of the work in producing the South Georgia and South Sandwich Islands laws
website it was decided to carry on the sequence informally until the end of 1985 — just beyond
the point when South Georgia and South Sandwich Islands became as separate Overseas

Territory.




PART I.

ORDINANCES.

Printed by and with the authority of the Attorney General, Stanley, Falkland Islands [2022].

TABLE OF CONTENTS



ORDINANCES OF THE COLONY OF THE FALKLAND ISLANDS

Ordinance No. 1 of 1984 Taxes and Duties (Special Exemptions) (Amendment) Ordinance 1984

“ “ 2 “ “ Falkland Islands Development Corporation (Amendment) Ordinance
1984
“ “ 3 “ “ Appropriation (1984-85) Ordinance 1984
“ “ 4 “ “ Old Age Pensions (Amendment) Ordinance 1984
5 Non-Contributory Old Age Pensions (Amendment) Ordinance 1984
6 Land (Amendment) Ordinance 1984

ORDINANCES OF THE DEPENDENCIES

Ordinance No. 1 of 1984 Income Tax (Amendment) Ordinance 1984













































PART II.

PROCLAMATIONS, REGULATIONS, ETc.




TABLE OF CONTENTS

Proclamation  No. 1 of 1984 Regarding the sitting of the Legislative Council on 8 March 1984

“ “ 2 “ “ Regarding the sitting of the Legislative Council on 27 June 1984
“ “ 3 “ “ Regarding the sitting of the Legislative Council on 15 January 1985
Regulation No. 1 of 1984 Pensions (Unestablished Locally Recruited Government Employees)
Regulations 1984
Order No. 1 of 1984 Education (Amendment) Ordinance 1983 Rectification Order 1984
“ “ 2 “ “ Falkland Islands Development Corporation (Commencement) Order
1984.
“ “ 3 “ “ Double Taxation Relief Arrangement (United Kingdom) Order 1984
“ “ 4 “ “ Medical Fees (Amendment) Regulations Order 1984
“ “ 5 “ “ Harbour Regulations (Amendment) Order 1984
“ “ 6 “ “ Post Office (Amendment) Order 1984
“ “ 7 “ “ Land (Fees Amendment) Regulations Order 1984
“ “ 8 “ “ Falkland Islands Development Corporation (Financial Year) Order
1984
“ “ 9 “ “ Registration (Fees Amendment) Regulations Order 1984

Order No. DS1 of 1984 Harbour (Gold Harbour) Order 1984

























































ORDINANCES
of the COLONY of the
FALKLAND ISLANDS

and of the
DEPENDENCIES

enacted during the year

1985
together with
(1) Rules Regulations etc., etc.; and
(2) selected instruments originating in the United Kingdom
that were published in the Falkland Islands Gazette in 1985.

Important Notes

(1) The sequence of publications of Ordinances, Rules and Regulations that began in 1920
ceased in 1981. As part of the work in producing the South Georgia and South
Sandwich Islands laws website it was decided to carry on the sequence informally until
the end of 1985 —just beyond the point when South Georgia and South Sandwich
Islands became as separate Overseas Territory.

(2) South Georgia and South Sandwich Islands became a separate and distinct British
Overseas Territory on 3 October 1985




PART I.

ORDINANCES.

Printed by and with the authority of the Attorney General, Stanley, Falkland Islands [2022].



Ordinance

No.

TABLE OF CONTENTS

ORDINANCES OF THE COLONY OF THE FALKLAND ISLANDS

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

of

1985

Land (Subdivision for non-residents) Ordinance 1985
Income Tax (Amendment) Ordinance 1985

Family Allowances (Amendment) Ordinance 1985
Appropriation (1985-86) Ordinance 1985

Supplementary Appropriation (1980-1984) Ordinance 1985
Old Age Pensions (Amendment) Ordinance 1985
Non-Contributory Old Age Pensions (Amendment) Ordinance 1985
Labour (Minimum Wage) (Amendment) Ordinance 1985
Education (Amendment) Ordinance 1985

Road Traffic (Amendment) Ordinance 1985

Land (Amendment) Ordinance 1985

Application of Enactments (Amendment) Ordinance 1985
Public Health (Amendment) Ordinance 1985

Immigration (Amendment) Ordinance 1985

Co-operative Societies Ordinance

Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Ordinance 1985

Post Office (Amendment) Ordinance 1985

Falkland Islands Development Corporation (Amendment) Ordinance
1985

Employment of Children (Amendment) Ordinance 1985
































































































































































































PART II.

PROCLAMATIONS, REGULATIONS, ETc.




Proclamation

Regulation

“«

Order

No.

No.

10

11

TABLE OF CONTENTS

of

1985

“«

“«

“«

“«

“«

1985

“«

“«

“«

“«

1985

“«

“«

“«

“«

“«

“

“

“«

“«

“«

Regarding the sitting of the Legislative Council on 26 June 1985
Regarding the Legislative Council dissolution on 6 September 1985
Setting 3 October 1985 as the date for elections to Legislative Council
Regarding the sitting of the Legislative Council on 8 October 1985
Regarding the protection of Brent Geese

Regarding the prohibition on the importation of certain foodstuffs,
fertile animal eggs and semen, and shearing equipment

Constitutional (Registration of Electors) Regulations 1985
Constitution (Registration of Electors) (No. 2) Regulations 1985

Constitutional (Qualification, nomination and election of candidates)
Regulations 1985

Constitutional (Registration of Electors) (Amendment) Regulations
1985

Constitutional (Qualification, nomination and election of candidates)
(No. 2) Regulations 1985

Pioneer Enterprise (South Atlantic Marine Services Limited) Order
1985

Road Traffic (Amendment) Regulations Order 1985

Land (Subdivision for non-residents) Application and Forms
Regulations Order 1985

Harbour Regulations (Amendment) No. 2 Order 1985

Road Traffic (Amendment) (No. 2) Regulations Order 1985
Pioneer Enterprise (Kiddcrafts) Order 1985

Pioneer Enterprise (Falkland Mill Limited) Order 1985
Immigration Regulations (Amendment) Order 1985

Legislative Council (Registration of Electors Forms) Order 1985

Legislative Council (Nomination and Election of Candidates Forms)
Order 1985

Defence Force (Hair) Regulations Order 1985



12

13

14

“«

“«

“«

“«

“«

“«

Wireless Telegraphy Regulations (Amendment) Order 1985
Immigration Regulations (Amendment) (No. 2) Order 1985

Harbour Regulations (Amendment) No 3 Order 1985

























































































































































PART IlI.

UNITED KINGDOM INSTRUMENTS PUBLISHED IN THE
FALKLAND ISLANDS GAZETTE




TABLE OF CONTENTS

Proclamation 15 May 1985 HM Queen’s Proclamation regarding Coinage











