
Schedule. SCHEDULE.

Amount.Number. Head of Service.
cl.£ s.

oThe Governor 
Agriculture 
Audit 
Aviation
Customs & Harbour 
Education 
Medical ...
Meteorological 
Military ...
Miscellaneous
Pensions & Gratuities
Police and Prisons
Posts & Telecommunications
Power & Electrical
Public Works
Public Works Recurrent
Secretariat & Treasury
Social Welfare
Supreme Court

08455
3355
2175

13445
11298
45546
34957

765
1160

31820
8530
5174

47481
18884
17285
35803
24706

7950
1824

%•0II. 0 V
0III. 0 Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 19th day of
0IV. 0 April, 1962.*0V. 0 *• E. P. ARROWSMITH, 

Governor.
0VI. 0
0VII. ! 

VIII. I
0

00
0IX. I 0
0X. 0
0XI. I 0

XII. I
XIII. 1
XIV. I
xv. j

XVI. 
XVII. 1 

XVIII. ! 
XIX. I

00
00
00
00
00
00 No. 6 19620 0
00

Total Ordinary Expenditure 0 0320613
Colony of the Falkland Islands.

XX.
XXL

Special Expenditure
Colonial Development & Welfare

0 024493
17862 0 0

IN THE ELEVENTH YEAR OF THE REIGN OFe

Total Expenditure £ 362968 0 0 HER MAJESTY QUEEN ELIZABETH II.
SIR EDWIN ARROWSMITH* K.C.M.G.

Governor.

An Ordinance
Further to amend the Income Tax Ordinance.

This printed impression has been carefully compared by 
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

Id. L. Bound,
Clerk of the Legislative Council.

me

Title.

[7$/ January, 1962

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland Enacting clause. 
Islands as follows —

Date of commencement.

1. (1) This Ordinance may be cited as the Income Tax Short title and
(Amendment) (No. 2) Ordinance, 1962, and shall be read as one with commencement, 
the Income Tax Ordinance (hereinafter referred to as the principal Cap. 32. 
Ordinance).

(2) This Ordinance shall be deemed to have come into force 
on the 1st January, 1962.

2. Section 5 of the principal Ordinance is amended —
(a) by repealing and replacing paragraph (b) as follows —

“(b) (i) gains or profits from any employment received in 
money;

(ii) the annual value of any allowance in respect of any 
employment received otherwise than in money as 
may be prescribed by rules made by the Governor 
in Council;”;

(b) by deleting the words “by or on behalf of the owner or
used” in paragraph (c).

Amendment of section 5 
of the principal 
Ordinance.

%
0

€

Falkland Islands:
Printed at the Government Printing Office by V. T. King.



tl

3. Section 15 of the principal Ordinance is amended —
(a) by deleting the figures “£100” in subsection ,(l) and

substituting the figures “£130”;
(b) by deleting the figures “£50” and “£25” in paragraph (a)

of subsection (3) and substituting the figures “£100” and 
“£50” respectively.

Amendment of section 15 
of the principal 
Ordinance.

i
Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 4th day of•3

4. Subsection (1) of Section 21 of the principal Ordinance it December, 1962.Amendment of section 21 
of the principal 
Ordinance. is amended —

E. P. ARROWSMITH*(a) by deleting the figures “£100” where those figures first
occur and by substituting the figures “£150”;

(b) by deleting the figures “£250” where those figures first
occur and by substituting the figures “£200”.

* Governor.

Si
This printed impression has been carefully compared by me 

with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

H. L. Bound,
Clerk of the Legislative Council.

i

;!

No. 7 1962

Colony of the Falkland Islands.

IN THE ELEVENTH YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

HER MAJESTY QUEEN ELIZABETH II.
SIR EDWIN ARROWSMITH, k.c.m.g.,

Governor.

An Ordinance
Further to amend the Firearms Ordinance.

[4th December, 1962]

Title.

Date of Commencement.

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland Enacting clause. 
Islands, as follows —

1. (1) This Ordinance may be cited as the Firearms (Amend- 
ment) Ordinance, 1962, and shall be read as one with the Firearms 
Ordinance (hereinafter referred to as the principal Ordinance).

(2) This Ordinance shall come into force on the 4th day of 
December, 1962.

Short title and 
commencement. 
Cap. 26.

2. Section 5 of the principal Ordinance is amended — Amendment of section 5
. of the principal

(a) by deleting the words by such member for the sole purpose Ordinance, 
of target shooting.” in paragraph (6) and substituting the 
words “or carried by such member in the performance of 
his duty;”;

o

3

(b) by adding after paragraph (6) the following new paragraphs- 
“(7) the Falkland Islands Defence Force Small Bore 

Rifle Club;
(8) a person in the service of the Government or 

the British Antarctic Survey having in his possession any 
firearm in the performance of his duty, such possession 
being specially authorised by the head of his Department.”.

Falkland Islands :
Printed at the Government Printing Office by V. T. King.


