
tl

3. Section 15 of the principal Ordinance is amended —
(a) by deleting the figures “£100” in subsection ,(l) and

substituting the figures “£130”;
(b) by deleting the figures “£50” and “£25” in paragraph (a)

of subsection (3) and substituting the figures “£100” and 
“£50” respectively.

Amendment of section 15 
of the principal 
Ordinance.

i
Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 4th day of•3

4. Subsection (1) of Section 21 of the principal Ordinance it December, 1962.Amendment of section 21 
of the principal 
Ordinance. is amended —

E. P. ARROWSMITH*(a) by deleting the figures “£100” where those figures first
occur and by substituting the figures “£150”;

(b) by deleting the figures “£250” where those figures first
occur and by substituting the figures “£200”.

* Governor.

Si
This printed impression has been carefully compared by me 

with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

H. L. Bound,
Clerk of the Legislative Council.

i

;!

No. 7 1962

Colony of the Falkland Islands.

IN THE ELEVENTH YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

HER MAJESTY QUEEN ELIZABETH II.
SIR EDWIN ARROWSMITH, k.c.m.g.,

Governor.

An Ordinance
Further to amend the Firearms Ordinance.

[4th December, 1962]

Title.

Date of Commencement.

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland Enacting clause. 
Islands, as follows —

1. (1) This Ordinance may be cited as the Firearms (Amend- 
ment) Ordinance, 1962, and shall be read as one with the Firearms 
Ordinance (hereinafter referred to as the principal Ordinance).

(2) This Ordinance shall come into force on the 4th day of 
December, 1962.

Short title and 
commencement. 
Cap. 26.

2. Section 5 of the principal Ordinance is amended — Amendment of section 5
. of the principal

(a) by deleting the words by such member for the sole purpose Ordinance, 
of target shooting.” in paragraph (6) and substituting the 
words “or carried by such member in the performance of 
his duty;”;

o

3

(b) by adding after paragraph (6) the following new paragraphs- 
“(7) the Falkland Islands Defence Force Small Bore 

Rifle Club;
(8) a person in the service of the Government or 

the British Antarctic Survey having in his possession any 
firearm in the performance of his duty, such possession 
being specially authorised by the head of his Department.”.

Falkland Islands :
Printed at the Government Printing Office by V. T. King.



3. Section 13 of the principal Ordinance is amended

(a) by deleting the words “for the sole purpose of target
shooting.” in paragraph (3) and substituting the woids 
“in the performance of his duty;”;

(b) by adding after paragraph (3) the following new paragraphs—

Amendment, of section 13 
of the principal 
Ordinance.

“(4) a member of the Falkland Islands Defence Force 
Rifle Club or the Falkland Islands Defence Force Small 
Bore Rifle Club when carrying a gun to or from the 
respective club range;

(5) a person in the service of the Government or the 
British Antarctic Survey when specially authorised by the 
head of his Department to carry a gun in the performance 
of his duty.”.

4. Section 1(1 of the principal Ordinance is amended —
(a) by re-numbering subsection (3) as subsection (4);
(b) by inserting after subsection (2) the following new sub­

section —
“(3) Notwithstanding the provisions of subsections 

(1) and (2) of this section, any member of the Boys’ 
Brigade or the Girls’ Life Brigade over the age of 12 years, 
may use a firearm in the presence of an officer of his or 
her Brigade for target practice at a recognised small bore 
rifle range.”.

Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 4th day of 
December, 1962.*

E. P. ARROWSMITH,
Governor.

Amendment of section 16 
of the principal 
Ordinance.

mm
Sip
Si

No. 8 1962
y([

ft5. Sections 17, 18 and 19 of the principal Ordinance are 
amended by deleting the word “firearm” wherever that word 
and substituting the word “gun”.

Amendment of sections 
17. 18 and 19 of the 
principal Ordinance.

Colony of the Falkland Islands.
occurs

IN THE ELEVENTH YEAR OF THE KEIGN OF

HER MAJESTY QUEEN ELIZABETH II.
SIR EDWIN ARROWSMITH, k.c.m.g.,

' Governor.

This printed impression has been carefully compared by 
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

H. L. Bound,
Clerk of the Legislative Council.

me

An Ordinance
To legalise certain payments made in the 

year 1961-62 in excess of the Expenditure 

sanctioned by Ordinance No. 8 of 1961.

Title.

WHEREAS it is expedient to make further provision for the 
service of the Colony for the period 1st July, 1961 to 30th June, 
1962.

Preamble.

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland 
Islands, as follows :—

Enacting clause.

This Ordinance may be cited for all purposes as the Short title. 
Supplementary Appropriation (1961-62) Ordinance, 1962.

1.%9

2. The sums of money set forth in the Schedule hereto Approp 
having been expended for the services therein mentioned beyond the expenditure for the 
amounts granted for those services by the Ordinance providing for fo 30th JuneU 1962. ’ 
the service for the period 1st July, 1961, to 30th June, 1962, the 

hereby declared to have been duly laid out and expended

nation of excess*

same are
for the service of the Colony in that period, and are hereby approved, 
allowed and granted in addition to the sum mentioned for those 
services in the said Ordinance.

Falkland Islands.
Printed at the Government Printing Office by V. T. King.


