
:.
W

Table of Contents «« Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 17th day of January 1974.
! E. G. LEWIS, 

Governor.
I

COLONY

Income Tax (Amendment) Ordinance 1974 

Public Health (Amendment) Ordinance 1974

Ordinance No. 1 of 1974

2 99 9999 1974No. 1
Marriage (Amendment) Ordinance 19743 99 9999

Land (Amendment) Ordinance 19744 99 9999

Appropriation (1974-5) Ordinance 1974 

Supplementary Appropriation (1972-73) Ordinance 1974 

Old Age Pensions (Amendment) Ordinance 1974

Colony of the Falkland Islands5 >>»» *>

6 9999 99

IN THE TWENTY-SECOND YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.7 99 9999

Non-contributory Old Age Pensions (Amendment) Ordinance 19748 Ernest Gordon Lewis, c.m.g., o.b.e. 
Governor.

99 9999

ILotteries (Amendment) Ordinance 19749 99 9999

An Ordinance
Further to amend the Income Tax Ordinance 

(Chapter 32).

Immigration (Amendment) Ordinance 197410 9999 99

4 L
Income Tax (Amendment) (No. 2) Ordinance 197411 99 9999

Title.
Marriage (Amendment) Ordinance 197412 99 9999

Stanley Town Public Services (Amendment) Ordinance 197413 (1st January 1974) Date of commencement.99 9999

Non-contributory Old Age Pensions (Amendment) (No. 2) Ordinance 197414*» 99 99

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland Enacting clause. 
Islands, as follows —Road Traffic (Amendment) Ordinance 197415 99 9999

(1) This Ordinance may be cited as the Income Tax short title and commence
ment.

1.Banking (Amendment) Ordinance 197416 99 99• 9
(Amendment) Ordinance 1974.

Companies and Private Partnership (Amendment) Ordinance 197417 (2) The provisions of this Ordinance shall have effect with 
respect to tax chargeable for the year of assessment commencing on 
the 1st day of January 1974, and for all subsequent years of assess
ment.

99 9999

Administration of Justice (Amendment) Ordinance 197418 99 9999

19 Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Ordinance 197499 9999

2. Section 14 (1) of the Income Tax Ordinance (hereinafter Amendment of section 14.
(Cap. 32)referred to as the principal Ordinance) is amended by deleting £400 

and substituting £500.DEPENDENCIES

3. Section 15 of the principal Ordinance is amended — Amendment of section 15.Ordinance No. DS 1 of 1974 Application of Colony Laws Ordinance 1974 

Appropriation (Dependencies) (1973-74) Ordinance 1974 

Application of Colony Laws (No. 2) Ordinance 1974 

Appropriation (Dependencies) (1974-75) Ordinance

in subsection (1) by deleting “£130” and substituting the 
following —

(a)
2

99 ** 99 999999

“£180”;It> 3 „»> »*»»
I in subsection (2) by deleting “£50” and substituting the 

following —
(b)4

99 * 99 999999 1974 * *
“£100”;

in subsection (3) (a) by deleting “£100” and substituting 
the following —

(c)
* %

“£200” and deleting “£50” and substituting
the following— “£100”;

:



(d) in subsection (4) by deleting “£150” and substituting the 
following — w Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 17th day of January 1974.4

“£230”.
E. G. LEWIS, 

Governor.4. Section 16 of the principal Ordinance is amended —Amendment of section 16. **
(a) in subsection (1) by deleting “£100” and “£125” and sub

stituting the following —
“£130” and “£150” respectively.

5. Section 16a of the principal Ordinance is amended by 
deleting “£500” wherever those figures occur and substituting the 
following —

Amendment of section 
16a.

“£600”.

6. Section 19 is amended —
(a) by deleting the word “directors” where that word occurs for 

the second time and substituting the following — 
“non-resident directors”; and

Amendment of section 19.

No. 2 1974

(b) in the marginal note by deleting “directors” and substituting 
the following — Colony of the Falkland Islands

“non-resident directors”.

7. Section 21 of the principal Ordinance is amended —
(a) in subsection (1) by deleting the words and figures from 

“On every £” to the figure “30p” and substituting the 
following —

IN THE TWENTY-SECOND YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.
Ernest Gordon Lewis, c.m.g., o.b.e.

Governor.

An Ordinance
Further to amend the Public Health Ordin

ance (Chapter 54).

Amendment of section 21.

“On every pound of: f1
the first £500 of chargeable income 15 per cent 
the next £500 „

„ „ £500 „
„ „ £1,000 „
„ ,, £1,000 „
„ „ £1,000 ,,

20 per cent 
25 per cent 
30 per cent 
35 per cent 
40 per cent

the remainder of chargeable income 45 per cent”;

Title.

(17th January 1974) Date of commencement.

in subsection 2 by deleting “30p” and substituting “40 per 
centum”;

by deleting subsection (2a).

(b) ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland 
Islands, as follows —

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Public Health (Amend
ment) Ordinance 1974.

2. Part II, Part IVa and the First Schedule of the Public 
Health Ordinance are hereby repealed.

Enacting clause.

(c)
Short title.

Repeal of Part II. Part IVa 
and the First Schedule. 

(Cap. 54)This printed impression has been carefully compared by 
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. Browning,
Clerk of the Legislative Council.

me

This printed impression has been carefully compared by me 
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. Browning,
Clerk of the Legislative Council.

Ref. INC/10/5.

Ref. MED/10/2.

! *

Falkland Islands:
Printed at the Government Printing Office by V. T. King.Falkland Islands:

Printed at the Government Printing Office by V. T. King.


