
3. The Schedule to the principal Ordinance is amended by 
deleting “£8.50”, “£6.00” and “£6.00” and substituting the following 
respectively —

Amendment of Schedule.

“£11.00”, “£8.00” and “£8.00”.
Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 7th day of July 1978.

J. R. W. PARKER, 
Governor.This printed impression has been carefully compared by me 

with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. Browning, 
for Clerk of Councils.

Ref. TRE/2/2.

No. 13 1978

Colony of the Falkland Islands

IN THE TWENTY-SEVENTH YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.
James Roland Walter Parker, c.m.g., o.b.e. 

Governor.

An Ordinance
Further to amend the Income Tax Title.

Ordinance.
(1st January 1979) Date of commencement.

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland 
Islands, as follows —

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Income Tax (Amend- short title and commence­
ment) (No. 3) Ordinance 1978, and shall apply to assessments for 
the year of assessment commencing on the 1st day of January 1979 
and to subsequent years of assessment.

ment.

2. Section 14 of the Income Tax Ordinance (hereinafter Amendment of section 14.
(Cap. 32)referred to as the principal Ordinance) is amended in subsection (1) 

by deleting “£750” and substituting the following —
“£850”.

3. Section 15 of the principal Ordinance is amended — Amendment of section 15.

(a) in subsection (1), by deleting “£300” and substituting the 
following —

“£350”;
(b) in subsection (2), by deleting “£150” and substituting the 

following —•.
“£175”;

Falkland Islands

Printed at the Government Printing Office by V. T. King. I
• ..i•; .j •:.L iii»S



(c) in subsection (3) (a) —
(i) by deleting “£350” and substituting the following

“£500”; and
(ii) by deleting “£250” and substituting the following

“£300”;
(d) in subsection (4), by deleting “£350” and substituting the 

following —
“£400”; and

(e) in subsection (5), by deleting “£200” and substituting the 
following —

Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 7th day of July 1978.

J. R. W. PARKER, 
Governor.“£850”.

4. Section 16 of the principal Ordinance is amended —Amendment of section 16.

(a) in subsection (1), by deleting “£250” and substituting the 
following —

“£300”; and
(b) in paragraph (i) of the proviso to subsection (1), by deleting 

“£280” and substituting the following —
“£320”.

5. Section 16a of the principal Ordinance is amended by 
deleting “£900” wherever it occurs and substituting the following —

“£1050”.

Amendment of section 
16a.

No. 14 1978

This printed impression has been carefully compared by me 
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. Browning, 
for Clerk of Councils.

Colony of the Falkland Islands

IN THE TWENTY-SEVENTH YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.
James Roland Walter Parker, c.m.g., o.b.e. 

Governor.Ref. INC/10/5.

An Ordinance
Further to amend the Old Age Pensions 

Ordinance 1952.
ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland 

Islands, as follows —

Title.

1. (1) This Ordinance may be cited as the Old Age Pensions 
(Amendment) Ordinance 1978.

(2) The provisions of section 2 and sections 4 to 8 of this 
Ordinance shall come into operation on the 3rd day of July 1978 and 
the provisions of sections 3 and 9 shall come into operation on the 
10th day of July 1978.

Short title and commence­
ment.

2. Section 2 of the Old Age Pensions Ordinance 1952 (herein- Amendment of section 2.
(3 of 1952)after referred to as the principal Ordinance) is amended —

(a) in the definition of “employed person” by deleting “18” and 
substituting the following —

“17”; and
(b) in the definition of “self-employed person” by deleting “18” 

and substituting the following —
“17”.

Falkland Islands

Printed at the Government Printing Office by V. T. King.


