
Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 2nd day of July 1980.

R. M. HUNT, 
Governor.

1980No. 8

Colony of the Falkland Islands

IN THE TWENTY-NINTH YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.
Rex Masterman Hunt, c.m.g. 

Governor.

An Ordinance
Further to amend the Income Tax Ordinance. Title.

(1st January 1981)

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Colony of the Falkland

Date of commencement.

Islands.

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Income Tax (Amend­
ment) (No. 2) Ordinance 1980 and shall come into operation on the 
1st January 1981 and shall apply to assessments for the year of 
assessment commencing on the 1st January 1981 and to subsequent 
years of assessment.

2. Section 14 of the principal Ordinance is amended in sub­
section (1), by deleting “£1,040” and substituting the following —

“£1,200”;

Short title and commence­
ment.

Amendment of section 14. 
(Cap. 32)

3. Section 15 of the principal Ordinance is amended — Amendment of section 15.

(a) in subsection (1), by deleting “£600” and substituting the 
following —

“£700”;

(b) in subsection (2), by deleting “£350” and substituting the 
following —

“£400”;

(c) in subsection (3) (a), by deleting “£600” and “£350” and 
substituting the following respectively —

“£700” and “£400”; and



Assented to in Her Majesty’s name this 16th day of May 1980.

(d) in subsection (4) by deleting ‘‘£1,040” and substituting the 
following —

R. M. HUNT, 
Governor.“£1,200”.

4. Section 16 of the principal Ordinance is amended —Amendment of section 16.

(a) in subsection (1), by deleting “£350” and substituting the 
following

“£400”; and

(b) in paragraph (i) of the proviso to subsection (1), by deleting 
“£380” and substituting the following —

“£440”.
No. DS 1 1980

5. Section 16a of the principal Ordinance is amended by 
deleting “£2,000” wherever it occurs and substituting the following —

“£2,350”.

6. Section 49 of the principal Ordinance is amended —
(a) by being renumbered as subsection (l) thereof; and
(b) by renumbering subsections (4), (5) and (6) as (2), (3) and (4) 

respectively.

Amendment of section 
16 a.

Falkland Islands Dependencies
Amendment of section 49.

IN THE TWENTY-NINTH YEAR OF THE REIGN OF

Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth II.
Rex Masterman Hunt, c.m.g. 

Governor.

An Ordinance
To apply certain Laws of the Colony to the 

Dependencies.

This printed impression has been carefully compared by me 
with the Bill which has passed the Legislative Council, and is found 
by me to be a true and correctly printed copy of the said Bill.

R. Browning,
Clerk of Councils. ENACTED for the Dependencies of the Colony of the Falkland 

Islands by the Governor of the Colony of the Falkland Islands and the 
Dependencies thereof —

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Application of Colony 
Laws Ordinance 1980 and shall come into operation on the 16th day 
of May 1980.

Ref. INC/10/5.

Short title and commence­
ment.

2. The Ordinances of the Colony specified in the first and 
second columns of the Schedule to this Ordinance are applied to 
the Dependencies, subject to such adaptations, qualifications and 
exceptions as local circumstances may render necessary.

SCHEDULE

Application of Colony 
Ordinances.

(Section 2)

Number Short title

Firearms (Amendment) Ordinance 1979.
Matrimonial Causes Ordinance 1979 
Maintenance Orders (Reciprocal Enforcement)

(Amendment) Ordinance 1979.

11 of 1979 
14 of 1979 
16 of 1979

«

Promulgated by the Governor on the 16th day of May 1980.

F. E. Baker,
Chief Secretary.

Ref. LEG/10/37.

Falkland Islands

Printed at the Government Printing Office by V. T. King.Falkland Islands

Printed at the Government Printing Office by V. T. King.


